Index

Section 1.

Section 2.

Section 3.

Section 4.

Section 5.

Section 6.

Section 7.

Section 8.

SECTION 1:

CHAPTER FOUR

AN ORDINANCE PERTAINING TO MINIMUM STANDARDS
GOVERNING CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE OF

BUILDINGS/STRUCTURES
Page

PUIPOSE . . .o et e 1
(14103 o | 7/ 2
Codes
1. BOCA National BuildingCode ............................... 2
2 CABO and Two Family DwellingCode ........................ 2
3 International MechanicsCode ............ ... ..., 3
4. BOCA National Fire PreventionCode . . ........................ 3
5. National Electrical Code .......... ..., 3
6 International PlumbingCode ............. ... ... ... .......... 4
7 Code for the Handicapped ......... ... ... ... . ... . . ... 4
8 LivabilityCode . ....... ...ttt 4
Applicability . . ... ..o e e 24
Enforcement .. ........ i e e 24
ConIICES . .ottt e 25
Severability . .........ciiii i e e 25
Addendum . ... e 26
PURPOSE.

The Mayor and Council have determined it to be in the best interest of the residents
and citizenry of the community and in the interest of protecting the public health and
safety to establish minimum standards governing the construction, alteration,
addition, repair, removal, occupancy, livability, maintenance, and all other matters
pertaining to buildings and structures.

Chapter 4 - Page 1



SECTION 2: AUTHORITY.

The Charter of the Town of Keedysville, Article 23 of the Annotated Code of the
General Laws of Maryland authorizes the Town of Keedysville as a municipal
corporation to establish certain minimum codes as set forth and to authorize, request
and designate Washington County to enforce and administer such codes if it so
desires.

SECTION 3. CODES.
The following are hereby adopted and considered to be in force in the appropriate
limits of the Town of Keedysville, a municipal corporation:

1.

BOCA National Building Code.

The 1996 BOCA National Building Code, Thirteenth Edition, 1996 as
published by the Building Officials and Code Administrators International,
Inc., and as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, Maryland, on October 7, 1997, with an effective date of October 7,
1997, be and is hereby adopted in its entirety with the same insertions,
amendments, and revisions as set forth therein. The BOCA National
Building Code, Thirteenth Edition, 1996 as passed by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, together with all
insertions, amendments, and revisions is incorporated herein by reference,
and attached and shall be kept on file with the Town Clerk.

Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted.

CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code.
The1995 addition of the CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code as

adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
Maryland, be and is hereby adopted and enacted. The said 1995 addition of
CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code, in its entirety as adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland effective
on October 7, 1997, is attached hereto and made a part hereof by reference
and a copy with all revisions, amendments and insertions shall be kept on file
with the Town Clerk.

Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted..

Chapter 4 - Page 2



The 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing.

The 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, except as otherwise
set forth herein, as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of October 7, 1997 be
and is hereby adopted in its entirety with the same insertions, amendments,
and revisions. The 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, as
passed by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
Maryland, together with all insertions, amendments, and revisions is
incorporated herein by reference and shall be kept on file with the Town
Clerk.

Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted.

The BOCA National Fire Prevention Code.

The BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, Ninth Edition, 1993, as published
by the Building Officials and Code Administrators International, Inc., and as
adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
Maryland, with an effective date of April 26, 1994 be and is hereby adopted
in its entirety with the same insertions, amendments, and revisions. The
BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, Ninth Edition, 1993, as passed by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, together with all
insertions, amendments, and revisions is incorporated herein by reference and
shall be kept on file with the Town Clerk.

Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted.

The National Electrical Code.

The National Electrical Code as adopted by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of
October 7, 1997, as amended or intended to be amended, is hereby adopted
in its entirety with the same insertions, amendments, and revisions. The
National Electrical Code as passed by the Board of County Commissioners
of Washington County, together with all insertions, amendments, and
revisions is incorporated herein by reference and shall be kept on file with the
Town Clerk.

Chapter 4 - Page 3



Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted.

The International Plumbing Code.

The International Plumbing Code as adopted by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of
October 7, 1997, be and is hereby adopted in its entirety with the same
insertions, amendments, and revisions. The International Plumbing Code as
passed by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
together with all insertions, amendments, and revisions is incorporated herein
by reference and shall be kept on file with the Town Clerk.

Any subsequent replacements, revisions, supplements, amendments, and
addendums issued thereto that from time to time may be adopted by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland are
hereby adopted.

The Code for the Handicapped.

The Maryland Access Code for the Handicapped as adopted by the State of
Maryland, and enforced by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County, Maryland, as it now exists and/or may be amended from
time to time, together with any subsequent replacements, revisions,
supplements, amendments, and addendums issued thereto that from time to
time may be adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, Maryland are hereby adopted.

Livability Code.
§.01 GENERAL.
A. Title: These regulations shall be known as the Town of

Keedysville Livability Code of “This Code™.

B. Scope: This Code is created to protect the public health, safety
and welfare in residential structures and premises by:

(1)  Establishing minimum property maintenance standard for
basic equipment and facilities used for light, ventilation,
heating and sanitation for residential structures and
premises, and for safety and sanitary maintenance of
residential structures and premises;

(2) Establishing minimum requirements for residential
structures and premises for means of egress, fire
protection systems and other equipment and devises
necessary for safety from fire;

Chapter 4 - Page 4



C.

(3) Fixing the responsibilities of property owners, operators

and tenants of residential structures and premises; and
(4)  Providing for administration, enforcement and penalties.
Intent. This Code shall be construed liberally and justly to
protect public health, safety and welfare insofar as they are
affected by the continued use and maintenance of residential
structures and premises.

§.02 DEFINITIONS

A.

B.

Rules of Interpretation:
(1)  Unless otherwise expressly stated, the terms defined in

Section B shall have the meanings indicated for purposes
of the Code.

(2) Words used in the present tense include the future; words
in the masculine gender include the feminine and neuter;
the singular number includes the plural and the plural the
singular.

(3) Where terms are not defined, through the methods
authorized by this section, they shall have their ordinarily
accepted meanings such as the context may imply.

Terms Defined:

(1) “Act”’means §11-403 of Article 41 of the Annotated Code
of Maryland.

(2) “Basement” means that portion of a structure which is
partly or completely below grade and having at least 50%
of its floor to ceiling height below finished grade.

(3) “Building Code” means the BOCA Basic/National Code.

(4) “Central Heating” means the heating system permanently
installed and adjusted so as to provide the distribution of
heat to all habitable areas from a source outside of these
areas.

(5) “Code” means the Livability Code.

(6) “Code Official” means the Director of the Department of
Permits and Inspections or his/her authorized agent or
designee.

(7) “Condemn” means to declare a structure or part thereof,
premises, or equipment, unsafe or unfit for use or
occupancy.

(8) “Electrical Code” means the National Electrical Code.

(9) “Extermination” means the control and elimination of
insects, rodents or other pests by eliminating their
harborage places; by removing or making inaccessible
materials that may serve as their food; by poison spraying,

Chapter 4 - Page 5



(10)

(11)

(12)

(13)

(14

(15)

(16)
)

(18)
(19)

(20)

fumigating, trapping, or by any other pest elimination
methods which have received all necessary and legally
required approvals.

“Garbage” means the animal and vegetable waste
resulting from the handling, preparation, cooking and
consumption of food.

“Habitable Area” means the space in a structure used for
living, sleeping, eating, or cooking including bathrooms
and toilet compartments.

“Housing Board of Review” - “Board” means the Mayor
and Council to hear waiver requests and appeals and
render decisions.

“Housing Unit” means a single unit of a structure
providing or intended to provide complete living and
sleeping facilities for one or more persons.

“Infestation” means the presence, within or contiguous to,
a structure or premises of insects, rodents, vermin or other
pests.

“Maintenance” means the repair and other acts intended
to prevent a decline in the condition of a structure,
premises, or equipment below the standards established
by this Code and other applicable statutes, codes and
ordinances.

“Occupant” means any individual having possession of a
space within a housing unit.

“Operator” means a person who has charge, care or
control of a structure or premises which is offered for
occupancy.

“Person” includes an individual, partnership, limited
partnership, trust, estate, association or corporation.
“Plumbing” means the practice, materials, facilities and
fixtures used in the installation, maintenance, extension or
alteration of all piping, fixtures, appliances and
appurtenances within the scope of the Washington County
Plumbing Code.

“Plumbing Fixture” means a receptacle or device which
is either permanently or temporarily connected to a water
distribution system of the premises, and demands a supply
of water therefrom; or discharges used water, liquid-borne
waste materials, or sewage either directly of indirectly to
the drainage system of the premises; or which requires
both a water supply connection and a discharge system of
the premises.

Chapter 4 - Page 6



21)

(22)

(23)

)

(25)
(26)

“Premises” means a lot, plot or parcel of land including
the structure thereon.
“Property Owner” means any person having a legal or
equitable interest in the premises, including the guardian
of the estate of any such person, or the executor or
administrator of the estate of such person if ordered to
take possession of the premises by a court.
“Rubbish” means refuse composed of paper, rags, cartons,
boxes, wood, excelsior, rubber, leather, tree branches,
yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass
crockery, dust and/or other similar materials as well as the
residue from the burning of wood, coal, coke and other
combustible materials.
“Structure” means a residential structure for human
habitation.
“Tenant” means an occupant other than a property owner.
“Ventilation” means the process of supplying and
removing air by natural or mechanical means to or from
any space.
(@) Mechanical: Ventilation by power-driven devices.
(b) Natural: Ventilation by opening to outer air, air
through windows, skylights, doors, louvers, or
stacks without power-driving devises.

§.03 APPLICATION

A. The Livability Code shall apply to residential structures located
in the Town of Keedysville used for human habitation except:

(D
@

3)

4

©)

Owner-occupied single family housing units;

Any housing exempted by the Mayor and Council of
Keedysville.

Any repairs or alterations to a structure, or changes of use
therein, which may be caused directly or indirectly by the
enforcement of this Code shall be done in accordance
with the procedures and provisions of applicable local
building code, plumbing code, mechanical code and
electrical code, or any other code or standard applicable
to housing.

The provisions in the Code shall not abolish or impair any
remedies available to the Code Official relating to the
removal or demolition of any structures which are deemed
to be dangerous, unsafe and unsanitary.

All repairs, maintenance, alterations or installations which
are required for compliance with this Code shall be

Chapter 4 - Page 7



executed an installed in accordance with industry
standards so as to secure the results intended by this Code.

§.04 CODE ENFORCEMENT

A.

Enforcement: It shall be the duty and responsibility of the Mayor
and Council to enforce the provisions of this Code as herein
provided.

A person may not be displaced by enforcement of this Code
unless the structure is deemed unsafe, unsanitary, deficient in
adequate exit facilities or which constitutes a fire hazard, or is
otherwise dangerous to human life by the Code official. The
Code Official shall notify the Mayor and Council and shall make
every effort to find alternate housing of comparable affordability
for any displaced persons.

§.05 DUTIES AND POWERS OF CODE OFFICIALS

A.

General: The Board of County Commissioners shall designate
the Code Official to enforce the provisions of this Code except
as may otherwise be specifically provided by these regulations.
Notices and Orders: The Code Official shall issue all notices and
orders necessary to insure compliance with this Code. Such
notices and orders shall include the procedure by which the
person served may appeal.

Inspection: The Code Official is authorized to enter any structure
or premises upon invitation by the owner or at any reasonable
time upon providing reasonable notice to the occupant and
owner, for the purpose of making inspections and performing
duties under this Code.

Alterations and Repairs: The Code Official has the authority to
require and approve any alterations or repairs necessary to bring
a structure or premises into compliance with this Code. The
determination of what may be necessary to bring such premises
into compliance shall take into consideration the use of
alternatives and equivalent approaches as provided for in this
Code. The Code Official shall have authority to approve
changes in any alterations or repairs in the field when conditions
are encountered which make the originally approved work
impractical, provided such changes in approved work can be
readily determined to be in compliance with this Code and other
applicable codes as outlined in §.03(B) and are requested by the
property owner or by his agent, describing the change in work
and the reasons and justification for the change, and shall be
filed with the permit for the project.

Chapter 4 - Page 8



E. Right of Entry: If any property owner, tenant or operator of a
structure refuses, impedes, inhibits, interferes with, restricts, or
obstructs entry and free access to any part of the structure or
premises where inspection authorized by the Code is sought, the
Code Official may seek, in a court of competent jurisdiction, an
order that such property owner, tenant, or operator cease and
desist from such interference.

F. Access by Property Owner or Operator: A tenant of a structure
or premises shall give the property owner or operator thereof, or
agent or employee, access to any part of such structure or its
premises at reasonable time upon being given reasonable notice
for the purpose of making such inspection, maintenance, repairs
or alterations as are necessary to comply with the provisions of
this Code.

G. Credentials: The Code Official shall disclose his credentials for
the purpose of inspecting any structure or premises.

H. Coordination of Enforcement: The inspection of structures and
premises, the issuance of notices and orders and enforcement
thereof shall be the responsibility of the Code Official.
Whenever, in the opinion of the Code Official initiating an
inspection under this Code, it is deemed necessary or desirable
to have inspections by any other governmental official or agency
the Code Official shall arrange for the coordination of such
inspections so as to minimize the number of visits by inspectors.
The Code Official shall confer with the other governmental
official or agency for the purpose of eliminating conflicting
orders before any are issued. The Code Official shall not,
however, cause the delay of the issuance of any orders by any
governmental official or agency which the governmental official
or agency determines must be issued.

I. Rule Making Authority: The Code Official shall have the power
as may be necessary in the interest of public safety, health and
general welfare, to promulgate and adopt rules and regulations
to interpret and implement the provisions of this Code to further
the intent thereof.

§.06 CONDEMNATION
A. General: When a structure or part thereof is found by the Code
Official to be unsafe or unfit for human occupancy or use as
defined in the Code, the Code Official may condemn the
structure or part thereof and may order the structure or part
thereof'to be placarded and vacated pursuant to the provisions of
this Code. The structure or part thereof shall not be reoccupied

Chapter 4 - Page 9



without approval of the Code Official. Unsafe equipment may
be condemned, placarded and placed out of service pursuant to
the provisions of this Code.

Unsafe Structure: An unsafe structure is one which all or part
thereof is found by the Code Official to be dangerous to life,
health, property, or the safety of its tenants by not providing
minimum protection from fire or because it is so damaged,
decayed, dilapidated, structurally unsafe, or of such faulty
construction or unstable foundation that it is likely to partially or
completely collapse.

Unsafe Equipment: Unsafe equipment includes any boiler,
heating equipment, cooking equipment, elevator, moving
stairway, electrical wiring or device, flammable liquid containers
or other equipment on the premises or within the structure which
is in such disrepair or condition that it is found by the Code
Official to be hazardous to life, health, property or safety of the
tenants of the premises of structure. Unsafe equipment may
contribute to the finding that the structure is unsafe or unfit for
human occupancy or use.

Structure Unfit for Human Occupancy: A structure is unfit for
human occupancy or use whenever the Code Official finds that
it is unsanitary, vermin or rodent infested, contains filth or
contamination, or lacks ventilation, illumination, sanitary or
heating facilities or other essential equipment required by this
Code.

Closing of Vacant Structures: Upon failure of a property owner
to close or vacate a premise within the time specified in an order,
the Code Official may cause the premises to be closed through
any available public agency or by contract or arrangement with
private persons and the cost thereof shall be charged against the
real estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a lien
upon such real estate.

If the owner fails to repay the Town for expenses incurred,
pursuant to this procedure, within thirty (30) days after written
demand has been mailed to the last known address, the Code
Official shall notify the Town Treasurer and a tax lien in favor
of the Town for the amount of the expenses incurred shall be
attached to the property. The property may be sold at tax sale to
satisfy a lien authorized by this section.

Chapter 4 - Page 10



§.07 NOTICES AND ORDERS

A. General: Whenever the Code Official determines that there has

C.

been a violation of this Code or has reasonable grounds to
believe that a violation has occurred, or whenever the Code
Official has determined to condemn any structure or part thereof
or equipment under the provisions of §.06, notice shall be given
to the property owner, operator or to the tenant in the manner
prescribed in this Code. Such notices and orders shall include
the procedure by which the person served may appeal. If the
Code Official has condemned the structure or part thereof or
equipment, the Code Official shall serve prior notice to the
property owner or operator and to the tenants of the intent to:
(1)  Orderthe structure or part thereof placarded or vacated; or
(2)  Order the equipment placed out of service.
Service by Notice: Notice shall be deemed to be properly served
upon a property owner, operator or tenant by one of the
following methods:
(1) By delivering to the person to be served or his/her agent
a copy of the notice and all other necessary papers; or
(2) a) By mailing to the person to be served at his/her last
known address or to his/her agent by certified or
registered mail with return receipt requested a copy of the
notice and all other necessary papers; or
b) If the certified or registered letter is returned with receipt
showing that it has not been delivered, by posting a copy
thereof in a conspicuous place in or about the structure
affected by such notice.
Notice to Vacate: When a condemnation order is served on a
tenant, the tenant shall be given reasonable time to vacate the
structure in accordance with applicable laws.
Transfer of Ownership: A property owner who has received a
compliance order or upon whom a notice of violation has been
served shall not sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise
dispose of the premises until the provisions of the compliance
order or notice of violation have been complied with, or until the
property owner shall first furnish the grantee, transferee,
mortgagee or lessee a true copy of the compliance order or notice
of violation issued by the Code Official and shall furnish to the
Code Official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee,
transferee, mortgagee or lessee, in which he acknowledges the
receipt of the compliance order or notice of violation and states
that he fully accepts and assumes the responsibility without

Chapter 4 - Page 11



§.08

§.09

§.10

condition for making the corrections or repairs required by such
compliance order or notice of violation.

Removal of Placard: A property owner, operator or tenant shall
not deface or remove a condemnation placard without the
approval of the Code Official.

VIOLATIONS

A.

Penalty: Any property owner, operator or tenant who willfully
violates any provision of this Code is guilty of a misdemeanor
and on conviction for each violation is subject to a fine not
exceeding $100 for each day that the violation exists or
imprisonment not exceeding three months, or both.

Other Penalties: Any penalty ordered under this Code is in
addition to and is not a substitute for any other penalty
authorized under a federal, state or local law.

RIGHT TO APPEAL

A.

Petition: Any person affected by any decision of the Code
Official which has been made in connection with the
enforcement of any provision of this Code, or of any rule or
regulation adopted pursuant to this Code, may request and may
be granted a hearing in a manner prescribed by the Mayor and
Council of Keedysville. Any person affected desiring a hearing
shall make a written request for a hearing within 15 days upon
receipt of a Certified letter of violation from the Code Official.

ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS

A.

B.

C.

Scope: The provisions of this regulation shall establish the
minimum standards for maintenance of premises and structures.
Premises Conditions:

(1)  Sanitation: All premises shall be maintained in a clean,
safe and sanitary condition free from any accumulation of
rubbish or garbage.

(2) Insect and Rodent Control: The premises shall be free
from infestation of insects, rodents, vermin or other pests.

Exterior Structure:

(1)  General: The exterior of a structure shall be maintained in
good repair, and shall be structurally sound and
maintained in a sanitary condition so as not to pose a
threat to the health, safety or welfare of the occupants.

(2)  Structural Members: All supporting structural members of
a structure shall be kept structurally sound, free of
deterioration and maintained capable of safely bearing the

Chapter 4 - Page 12



3)

4

)

(6)

Q)

®)

®

(10)

dead and live loads imposed upon them in accordance
with the Building Code.

Exterior Surfaces: Every foundation, exterior wall, roof,
and all other exterior surfaces shall be maintained in good
repair and shall be kept in such conditions to exclude
rodents and other pests.

Foundation Walls: All foundation walls shall be
structurally sound and shall be maintained free from open
cracks and breaks.

Exterior Walls: Every exterior wall shall be free of holes,
breaks, loose or rotting boards or timbers, and any other
conditions which might admit rain or dampness to the
interior portions of the walls or to the occupied areas of
the structure.

Roofs and Drainage: The roof shall be structurally sound,
and shall not have defects which might admit rain. Roof
drainage shall be adequate to prevent rain water from
causing dampness or deterioration in the walls or interior
portion of the structure.

Decorative Features: All cornices, entablatures, belt
courses, corbels, terra cotta trim, wall facings and similar
decorative features shall be maintained in good repair
with proper anchorage and in a safe condition.

Signs, Marquees and Awnings: All canopies, marquees,
signs, metal awnings, stairways, fire escapes, standpipes,
exhaust ducts and similar overhang extensions shall be
maintained in good repair, be properly anchored and kept
in a safe and sound condition. They shall be protected
from the elements and against decay and rust by the
periodic application of a weathercoating material such as
paint or other protective treatment.

Chimneys: All chimneys, cooling towers, smoke stacks
and similar appurtenances shall be maintained structurally
sound, safe, properly flashed and caulked and in good
repair. All exposed surfaces of metal or wood shall be
protected from the elements and against decay or rust by
periodic application of weathercoating materials such as
paint or similar surface treatment.

Stairs and Porches: Every exterior stair, porch, fire escape
balcony and all appurtenances attached thereto shall be
safe to use and capable of supporting the anticipated loads
and shall be maintained in a safe and sound condition and

Chapter 4 - Page 13



(1)

(12)

(13)

(14

(15)

(16)

good repair. Guards and handrails shall be maintained in
accordance with the Building Code.

Windows., Doors and Frames: Every window, door and
frame shall be maintained so as to exclude rain and
rodents as completely as possible, and to substantially
exclude wind from entering the structure.

Weathertight: Every window and exterior door shall be
fitted reasonably in its frame and be weathertight. Every
window shall be free of cracks and holes.

Openable Windows: Every window, other than a fixed
window, shall be capable of being easily opened from the
inside and shall be capable of being held in position.
Insect Screens: During the period from April 1 to
December 1, every door and window or other outside
opening use for ventilation purposes shall be supplied
with tight fitting insect screens.

Exception: Upon the prior approval of Code Official,
screens may not be required for exterior doors or other
types of openings which make screening impractical, such
as openings equipped with air conditioning units or
openings above the fourth floor. The Code Official may
approve alternatives to screens.

Door Hardware: Every exterior door and its hardware
shall be maintained in good condition. Door locks on all
interior and exterior doors entering housing units shall be
in good repair and capable of tightly securing the door.

Interior Structure:

(D

@

3)

“4)

General: The interior of a structure and its equipment and
facilities shall be maintained in good repair, structurally
sound and in a sanitary condition so as not to pose a threat
to the health, safety or welfare of the occupants.
Structural Members: All supporting structural members of
a structure shall be kept structurally sound, free of
deterioration and maintained capable of safely carrying
the loads imposed upon them in accordance with the
Building Code.

Interior Surfaces: Floors, walls (including windows and
doors), ceilings and other interior surfaces shall be
maintained in good repair and in clean, safe and sanitary
condition.

Bathroom and Kitchen Floors: Every toilet, bathroom and
kitchen floor shall be maintained so as to be substantially

Chapter 4 - Page 14



©)

(6)

(M

®

)

impervious to water to permit such floor to be easily kept
in a clean and sanitary condition.

Sanitation: The interior of a structure shall be maintained
in a clean and sanitary condition free from any
accumulation of rubbish or garbage. Rubbish or garbage
shall not be allowed to accumulate or be stored in public
halls or stairways.

Insect and Rodent Harborage: A structure shall be kept
free from any infestation, and where infestation is found,
the area shall be promptly exterminated by processes
which will not be harmful to human health. Continuing
or repeated incidents of infestation, as determined by the
Code Official, shall require the installation of rodent and
vermin-proof walls. The rodent and vermin-proof walls
shall be installed in accordance with the Building Code.

Exit Doors: Every door available as an exit shall be
capable of being opened easily from the inside.

Exit Facilities: All interior stairs and railings and other
exit facilities of a structure shall be maintained in sound
condition and good repair. Every interior stair used for
exit shall be maintained so as to be safe to use and
capable of supporting the anticipated loads.

Lead Paint Abatement: All surfaces such as walls,
ceilings, doors, trim molding, window frames, radiators,
stair banisters in a deteriorated condition which present a
potential health hazard due to lead paint shall have the
painted surfaces abated by and in accordance with the
Maryland Department of the Environment Regulations
Title 26, Subtitle 02, “Procedures for Abating Lead
Containing Substances from Buildings”, effective August
8,1988.

§.11 LIGHT AND VENTILATION REQUIREMENTS
A. General

)

@

Scope: The provisions of this regulation shall govern the
minimum standards for basic equipment and facilities
used for light and ventilation of a structure.

Alternative Methods and Devices: In place of the means
for natural light and ventilation herein prescribed,
alternative arrangement of windows, louvers or other
devices or methods that will provide the equivalent
minimum performance requirements shall be permitted in
order to comply with the Building Code.

Chapter 4 - Page 15



B.

Light:

(1) General: All areas in a structure shall be provided
sufficient light so as not to endanger health and safety.
All areas in a structure shall be provided with natural light
or equipment to accommodate artificial light of sufficient
intensity and distributed so as to permit the maintenance
of sanitary conditions and the safe use of the area and the
appliances, equipment and fixtures.

(2) Common Halls and Stairways: Every common hall and
stairway in a structure, other than one and two-family
structures, shall be adequately lighted at all times with an
illumination equivalent to the foot candles provided by at
least a 60-watt standard incandescent light bulb for each
200 square feet of floor area, provided that the spacing
between lights shall not be greater than 30 feet. Every
exterior stairway shall be illuminated.

Mechanical Ventilation:

Where mechanical ventilation is provided in lieu of natural

ventilation, such mechanical ventilating system shall be

maintained in operation during the occupancy of the structure or
portion thereof. When part of the air provided by a mechanical
ventilation system is recirculated, the portion or volume of air
recirculated shall not be recirculated to a different habitable area.

§.12 PLUMBING FACILITIES AND FIXTURE REQUIREMENTS

A.

B.

Scope:
The provisions of this regulation shall govern the minimum

standards for plumbing facilities and fixtures.
Required Plumbing Facilities:
Every housing unit shall include its own plumbing facilities
which shall be maintained in proper operating condition, can be
used in privacy, and are adequate for personal cleanliness and the
disposal of human waste. The following minimum plumbing
facilities shall be supplied and maintained in a sanitary and safe
working condition:

(1) Water Closet and Lavatory: Every housing unit shall
contain within its walls, a room separate from other
habitable areas, which provides a water closet supplied
with cold running water and which affords privacy. A
lavatory shall be placed in the same room as the water
closet or located in another room, in close proximity to
the door leading directly into the room in which said

Chapter 4 - Page 16



@)

€)

water closet is located. The lavatory shall be supplied
with hot and cold running water;

Bathtub or Shower: Every housing unit shall contain a
room which is equipped with a bathtub or shower
supplied with hot and cold running water and which
affords privacy; and

Kitchen Sink: Every housing unit shall contain a kitchen
sink apart from the lavatory required under Subsection
(1), and such sink shall be supplied with hot and cold
running water.

Alternative Plumbing:

Alternative plumbing facilities and fixtures for use in housing
units may be allowed as approved on a case-by-case basis by the
Code Official.

Plumbing Fixtures:

(D

2

3

“)

General: All plumbing fixtures shall be maintained in a
safe and usable condition. All plumbing fixtures shall be
of nonabsorbent material and shall have received all
necessary and legally required approvals.

Connections: Water supply lines, plumbing fixtures, vents
and drains shall be properly installed, connected and
maintained in working order and shall be kept free from
obstructions, leaks and defects and shall be capable of
performing the function for which they are designed. All
repairs and installations shall be made in accordance with
the provisions of the Building Code or Plumbing Code.
Maintenance: All plumbing fixtures shall be maintained
in a clean and sanitary condition so as not to breed insects
and rodents, or produce dangerous of offensive gases or
odors.

Access for Cleaning: Plumbing fixtures shall be installed
to permit easy access for cleaning the fixture and the area
around it.

Water System:

)

@

General: Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking
fountain, water closet or other plumbing facility shall be
properly connected to either a public water system orto a
private water system which has received all necessary and
legally required approvals.

Contamination: The water supply shall be maintained free
from contamination. All water inlets for plumbing
fixtures shall be located above the overflow rim of the
fixture.

Chapter 4 - Page 17



(3) Water Supply: The water supply system shall be installed
and maintained to provide at all times a supply of water to
plumbing facilities, fixtures, devices and appurtenances in
sufficient volume and at pressures adequate to enable
them to function satisfactorily.

(49) Water Heating Facilities: Water heating facilities shall be
installed in a manner which has received all necessary and
legally required approvals, properly maintained with
emergency relief valves in accordance with the Plumbing
Code, and properly connected with hot water lines to the
fixtures required to be supplied with the hot water. Water
heating facilities shall be capable of heating water to such
a temperatures so as to permit an adequate amount of
water to be drawn at every kitchen sink, lavatory basin,
bathtub, shower and laundry facility or other similar
facilities, at a temperature of not less than 100 degrees F.

F. Sewage System:

(1)  General: Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking
fountain, water closet or other plumbing facility shall be
properly connected to either a public sewer system or
private sewage disposal system which has received all
necessary and legally required approvals.

(2) Maintenance: Every plumbing stack, waste and sewer line
shall be installed and maintained so as to function
properly and shall be kept free from obstructions, leaks
and defects to prevent structural deterioration or health
hazards. All repairs and installations shall be made in
accordance with the provisions of the Building Code or
Plumbing Code.

§.13 MECHANICAL AND ELECTRICAL REQUIREMENTS
A. General:

¢)) Scope: The provisions of this regulation shall govern
the minimum standards for mechanical and electrical
facilities and equipment.

B. Heating Facilities:

(D Residential Structures: Every housing unit shall be
supplied with sufficient heat or heating equipment
capable of supplying sufficient heat during the period
from October 1 to May 15, to maintain a room
temperature of not less than 65 degrees F. in all
habitable areas during the hours between 6:30 a.m.
and 10:30 p.m. of each day and maintain a

Chapter 4 - Page 18



2

€))

4)

)

6

Q)

temperature of not less than 60 degrees F. during
other hours. The temperature shall be measured at a
point 3 feet above the floor and 3 feet from exterior
walls. EXCEPTION: When the exterior temperature
falls below O degrees F. and the heating system is
operating at its full capacity, a minimum room
temperature of 60 degrees F. shall be maintained at
all times.

Cooking and Heating Equipment: All cooking and
heating equipment, components and accessories in
every heating, cooking and water heating device shall
be maintained free from leaks and water flow
obstructions, and kept functioning properly so as to
be free from fire, health and safety hazards. All
installations and repairs shall be made in accordance
with the provisions of the Building Code, Electrical
Code, or other applicable laws or ordinances thereto.
Portable cooking equipment employing flame is
prohibited, except for residential type food trays or
salvers which are heated by a candle or alcohol lamp
and which have received all necessary and legally
required approvals.

Installation: All mechanical equipment used for
heating and cooking shall be properly installed and
safely maintained in good working condition, and
shall be capable of performing the function for which
it was designed and intended.

Fuel-Burning Equipment: All fuel-burning equip-
ment shall be connected to a chimney, flue or vent in
accordance with applicable local or State codes or
per manufacturer’s instructions in cases where no
local or State codes apply.

Clearances: All necessary and legally required
clearances to combustible materials shall be
maintained in accordance with the Building Code.
Safety Controls: All safety controls for fuel-burning
equipment shall be maintained in effective operation
in accordance with applicable local or State codes, or
per manufacturer’s instructions in cases where no
local or State codes apply.

Combustion Air: A supply of air for complete
combustion of the fuel and for ventilation of the
space be provided for fuel-burning equipment.

Chapter 4 - Page 19



C.

®

®

(10)

Unauthorized Devices: Devices purporting to reduce
gas consumption by attachment to a gas appliance,
the gas supply line thereto, or the vent outlet or vent
piping therefrom shall not be used unless labeled for
such use and the installation has specifically received
all necessary and legally required approvals.
Fireplaces: Fireplaces, and other construction and
devices intended for use similar to a fireplace, shall
be stable and structurally safe and connected to
chimneys which have received all necessary and
legally required approvals.

Climate Control: When facilities for interior climate
control (heating, cooling and humidity) are integral
functions of housing units, such facilities shall be
maintained and operated in accordance with the
designed capacity.

Electrical Facilities:

(D

@

3)

)

)

Facilities Required: Provided that there is usable
electric service available from a power line not more
than 300 feet away, a structure shall be adequately
and safely provided with an electrical system in
compliance with the requirements of this section.
Receptacles: Each habitable area in a housing unit
shall contain at least one receptacle outlet. Each
laundry area and bathroom shall contain at least one
GFCI protected receptacle. Any receptacle within
6'0" of a plumbing fixture shall be GFCI protected.
Lighting Fixtures: Every public hall, interior
stairway, water closet compartment, bathroom,
laundry room and furnace room shall contain at least
one electric lighting fixture.

Service: When the electrical system requires
modification to correct a violation of this section, the
service shall be corrected to a minimum of 60
ampere, three wire service.

Installation: All electrical equipment, wiring and
appliances shall be installed and maintained in a safe
manner in accordance with the Electrical Code. All
electrical equipment shall be of a type which has
received all necessary and legally required approvals.

Chapter 4 - Page 20



§.14

FIRE SAFETY REQUIREMENTS

A.

Scope:

The provisions of this regulation shall govern the minimum
standards for fire safety facilities and equipment. All structures
shall be constructed and maintained to prevent and avoid fire
hazards, and in a manner conducive to fire safety.

B. Means of Egress:

(D

()

3)
4
)
©)

General: A safe, continuous and unobstructed means
of egress shall be provided from the interior of a
structure to the exterior as a street, yard, court, or
passageway leading to a public open area at grade.
Direct Exit: Every housing unit shall have access
directly the outside or to a common area that leads
directly to the outside.

Doors: All doors in the required means of egress
shall be easily opened from the inner side.

Fire Escapes: All fire escapes shall be maintained in
working condition and structurally sound.

Exit Signs: All exit signs shall be illuminated and
visible in accordance with the Building Code.
Emergency Escapes: Every sleeping room located in
a basement shall have at least one openable window
and exterior door for emergency egress or rescue in
accordance with the Building Code which has
received all necessary and legally required approvals
or shall have access to two separate exits which have
received all necessary and legally required approvals
in accordance with the Building Code.

C. Accumulations and Storage:

(D

@

€))

General: Garbage or rubbish shall not be allowed to
accumulate or be stored overnight in stairways,
passageways, doors, windows, fire escapes or other
means of egress.

Flammable Matter: Highly flammable or explosive
matter, such as paints, volatile oils and cleaning
fluids, or combustible rubbish such as waste paper,
boxes and rags, shall not be accumulated or stored on
premises except in reasonable quantities consistent
with normal usage.

Residential Unit: A housing unit shall not be located
within a structure containing an establishment
handling, dispensing or storing flammable liquids

Chapter 4 - Page 21



with a flash point of 100 degrees F. or lower, except
as provided for in the Building Code.
D. Fire Resistance Ratings:

Floors, walls, ceilings, and other elements and components

which are required by the Fire Code to comply with a fire

resistance rating shall be maintained so that the respective
fire resistance rating of the enclosure, separation, or
construction is preserved.

E. Fire Protection Systems:

§)) General: All fire protection systems and equipment
shall be maintained in proper operating condition at
all times.

2) Smoke Detectors: All housing units shall be provided
with a minimum of one single station smoke detector
in the vicinity of each sleeping area. The smoke
detectors shall be installed and maintained in
accordance with the Building and Electrical Codes.
When actuated, the smoke detector shall provide an
alarm suitable to warn the occupants within the unit.

3) Fire Suppression System: Fire suppression systems
in housing units so equipped shall be maintained in
good condition, free from mechanical defect.
Sprinkler heads shall be kept clean and free of
corrosion and paint, and shall not be bent or
damaged.

4) Fire Extinguisher: All portable fire extinguishers in
housing units so equipped shall be visible and
accessible, and maintained in an efficient and safe
operating condition.

F. Fire Doors:

All necessary and legally required fire resistance rated doors

or smoke barriers shall be maintained good working order,

including all hardware necessary for the operation thereof.

The use of door stops, wedges and other hold-open devices

which have not received all necessary and legally required

approvals or which have been denied approval is prohibited.

§.15 RESPONSIBILITIES OF PERSONS
A. Scope:
The property owner, operator or tenant shall be responsible for
compliance with the provisions of this Code, and may be cited
for violations thereof, except as provided in this regulation. A
person shall not rent or lease to another person for occupancy or

Chapter 4 - Page 22



use any housing unit unless the structure and premises comply
with the provisions of this Code.

General:

A property owner or operator may not be cited for a violation of
this Code that is caused by the negligent, wrongful or malicious
acts or omissions of a tenant, provided that the property owner’s
acts or omissions have not contributed in any way to cause the
violation.

Sanitary Conditions:

(D

@

3)

4

The tenant shall be responsible for keeping that part of the
structure or premises which the tenant occupies, controls
or uses in a clean and sanitary condition. Every property
owner of a structure containing two or more housing units
shall maintain, in a clean and sanitary condition, the
common areas of the structure and premises.

Disposal and Storage of Rubbish and Garbage: The tenant
shall be responsible for the storage and disposal of
rubbish and garbage in a clean and sanitary manner as
may be required by applicable laws or ordinances.
Supplied Fixtures and Equipment: The tenant shall be
responsible for keeping owner-supplied equipment and
fixtures clean and sanitary, and for the exercise of
reasonable care in their proper use and operation. The
property owner shall be responsible for maintaining such
equipment and fixtures in good and proper operating
condition.

Furnished by Tenant: The tenant shall be responsible for
the maintenance of equipment and fixtures furnished by
the tenant. Such equipment and fixtures shall be properly
installed, and shall be maintained in good working
condition, kept clean and sanitary, and free of defect,
leaks or obstructions.

Extermination:

(D

@

€))

All Structures: If necessary, the property owner, operator
or tenant shall be responsible for extermination within the
structure and on the premises prior to renting or leasing
the structure.

Single Occupancy: The tenant of a structure containing a
single housing unit shall be responsible for the
extermination of any insects, rodents or other pests in the
structure or on the premises.

Multiple Occupancy: Every property owner or operator of
a structure containing two or more housing units shall be

Chapter 4 - Page 23



SECTION 4.

SECTION 5.

responsible for the extermination of any insects, rodents
or other pests in the structure or on the premises except
where infestation within a housing unit is caused by a
failure of the tenant to take reasonable action to prevent
such infestation within the housing unit.
E. Fire Safety:
Responsibility for installing and maintaining in good
working order any smoke detector installed pursuant to this
Code shall be in accordance with the State Fire Laws.
Article 38A and 12A, Annotated Code of Maryland, Smoke
Detection Systems.

§.15 SEVERABILITY

The provisions of these regulations are severable. A judgment by any
court of competent jurisdiction finding or declaring that any
provisions of these regulations or the application of any provision to
any person or circumstance in invalid does not affect the validity of
the remaining provisions of the regulations or any other application
of these regulations, and the remaining regulations shall have full
force and effect as if no judgment has been entered.

APPLICABILITY.
All portions of any of the above ordinances referred to shall be construed and be
applicable within the geographical confines of the Town of Keedysville, Maryland.

Where appropriate and in the sense of understanding where proper the Mayor and
Council of Keedysville, and/or Town of Keedysville is hereby inserted and made
applicable.

ENFORCEMENT.

This ordinance shall be enforced by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County pursuant to the provisions of Article 23A, §2B of the Annotated
Code of Maryland unless otherwise indicated and determined by resolution of the
Mayor and Council of the Town of Keedysville as its duly constituted legislative
body.

Any person or agency designated throughout this ordinance as the building
official(s), inspector, building inspector, code official, and/or code enforcement
official, or other equivalent position shall be any person or persons designated by the
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, from time to
time unless otherwise designated by the Mayor and Council of the Town of
Keedysville.

Chapter 4 - Page 24



SECTION 6. CONFLICT.
If this ordinance as adopted, conflicts in any way with any federal, state, county or
municipal act, ordinance or regulation applicable to any of the matters contained
herein, then and in said event then the regulation, ordinance or statute or act which
contains the more stringent regulations shall take precedence and control.

SECTION 7. SEVERABILITY.
If any portion of this ordinance shall be deemed invalid by a court of competent
jurisdiction, all remaining portions of this ordinance shall remain in full force and
effect.

Copies of the Ordinances passed by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
Maryland referred to in §3 Codes, BOCA National Building Code, CABO and Two Family Dwelling
Code, The International Mechanics Code, The BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, The National
Electrical Code, The International Plumbing Code, and The Code for the Handicapped are attached
hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

Chapter 4 - Page 25



ADDENDUM TO AN ORDINANCE PERTAINING TO
MINIMUM STANDARDS GOVERNING CONSTRUCTION AND
MAINTENANCE OF BUILDINGS/STRUCTURES

Section 3 sets forth certain codes adopted by Washington County which are incorporated in
this Ordinance by reference.

Those contained herein for reference purposes are as follows:

A. The 1996 BOCA National Building Code, Thirteenth Edition, 1996 as
published by the Building Officials and Code Administrators International,
Inc., and as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, Maryland, on October 7, 1997, with an effective date of October 7,
1997.

B. The 1995 addition of CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code, in its
entirety as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, Maryland effective on October 7, 1997.

C. The 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, except as otherwise
set forth herein, as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of October 7, 1997.

D. The BOCA National Fire Prevention code, Ninth Edition, 1993, as published
by the Building Officials and Code Administrators International, Inc., and as
adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,
Maryland, with an effective date of April 26, 1994.

E. The National Electrical Code as adopted by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of
1994, amended October 7, 1997, and as amended or intended to be amended
in 2002.

F. The International Plumbing Code as adopted by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, with an effective date of
October 7, 1997.

Note: As indicated attachments are for reference purposes. The current codes as adopted from time

to time by the Board of County Commissioners and on file with the County are intended and shall
be the applicable codes.

Chapter 4 - Page 26



" ACTS, ORDINANCES &
RESOLUTIONS - COUNTY

’ ' AN ORDINANCE REPEALING THE 1993 BOCA NATIONAL BUILDING
CODE, WITH AMENDMENTS, AND ENACTING
THE BOCA NATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THIRTEENTH EDITION, 1996
WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, being
concerned with~providing protection for the consumer, general public, and owners and occupants of
buildings and structures in Washington County, adopted on April 26, 1994, the 1993 BOCA National
Building Codé, with local a;meﬁd:nents forFWashington County; and

WI—fEREAS, it has been recommended to the County Commissioners of Washiqgton County, '
Maryland, that they adopt the BOCA Natiqnal Building Code, Thirteenth Edition, 1996, Which is
ﬁ;ore ﬁp-to-date énd which providgs greater safeguards for the consumer, general public, o'wners and
’occupants of buildings and structures in Washington County; if implemented, and provi&es for
rmmmum regulations governing tl;e design, construc.tion. alte;ation, enlargement, repair, demolition,
removal, maintenance and use of all buildings and structures; prﬁvides for the issuance of permits,
collection of fees, making of inspections; and provides for penalties for the violatioﬁ ihereo»f; and

WHEREAS, épublic hearing was held on September 23, 1997, following dﬁé notice and
advertisement of the text of the BOCA National Bujlding Code, Thirteenth Edition, i996, with local
amendments for Waéhington County; and | |

WHEREAS, public comment was received. reviewed and considered concerning the repeal

of the 1993 BOCA National Bdilding Code, with amendments, and the adoption of the BOCA

National Building Code, Thirteenth Edition, 1996. with local amendments for Washington County.



VUuuUJI uUuuu<Z

CLERK OF THE CI®CUIT COQURT
VWASHINGTCH CQURTY

4

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
Corninissioners of Washington County, Maryland, that the 1993 BOCA National Building ACode,
with amendments, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conﬂictb herewith are hereby
repea;lé_d; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, that the BOCA National Building Code,
Thirteehth Edition, 1996, the contents of which are incorporated herein by reference, be and is

enacted with the following insertions, amendments, and additions:

ok kK kK KR K K
.Th¢ Maryland Building Pe;forrﬁénce Swndirds Regulations (MBPS), which are set fbrth at
COMAR 05.02.07, include the BOCA National Building Code and mandate certain amendments to |
comply with other State laws. The following chapters are heréby amended by the insertions set forth

below:

(1) Chapter 9 of the BOCA Code: Fire protection system réquirements of Chapter 9 may
be concurrently covered in the State Fire Code, Article 384, §§3—=67, and COMAR 12.03.01. The
State F ife Code is enforced by the Sfate Fire Marshal or authorized fire official.

2) Chapter 10 of the BOCA Code: Means of egress requirements of Chapter 10 may be
concurrently covered in the State Fire Cé,de, Article 38A, §§3—¢67, and CQMAR 12.03.01. The
- State F.iré Code is enforéed by the State Fire Marshal or .;:mthorized fire ofﬁcial.

(3)  Chapter 11 of the BOCA Code related to accessibility requirements is hereby
replaced with the Maryland Accessibility Code set forth in COMAR 05.02.02.

(4)  Chapter 13 of the‘ BOCA Code: The requifements concerning energy conservation

for buildings and structures are governed by Article 78, §54J, Energy Conservation Building

-2-



Standards Act, Annotated Code of Maryland, as amended. In the event of a conflict between the

. Annotated Code.of Maryland and the BOCA Code, the requirements of the Annotated Code of

Maryland shall prevail.

(5) * _ Chapter 24 of BOCA Code: The requirements of safety glazing set forth in Article
83B, §§6-301—6-306, Annotated Code of Maryland are in addition to C}_lapter 24, §2405.0 of the
BOCA Code related to safety glazing. In the event of a conflict between Chapter 24 of the BOCA
Code and the Annotated Code of Ma.ryland, the requirements of the Annotated Code of Maryland
shall prevail.

(6)  Chapters 27, 28 and 29 of the BOCA Code related to electrical, mechanical, and
plumbing systems respectively, are in addition to and not instead of State law govenﬁng these areas
set forth in Article 38 A, §§59—66, Business Regulation Article, Tiﬂe 9A, Business Occupaﬁons and
Profess:ions Article, Title 12, Annotated Codevof Méryla.nd. In the event of a‘conﬂict between the
10CA Code and the Annotated Code of Maryland, the provisions of the Annotated Code of
Maryland shall prevéil. | |

@) | Chapter 30 of the BOCA Code: The provisions of Chapter 30 of the BOCA Code
felated to elevators and conveying systems and are in: addition‘to and not iﬁstegd of the requirements
set forth in Article 89, §49B, Annotated Code of Maryland, the provisions of the Annotated Code

of Maryland shall prevail.

The following sections are hereby revised by the substitution or insertion, as apphcable of
the following paragraphs were indicated:

SECTION 101.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

101.1 Title: These regulatmns shall be known as the Bmldmg Code of Washington County,
Maryland, hereinafter referred to as "this code". ‘ ‘



SECTION 101.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

101.2 Scope: These regulations shall control all matters concemning the construction,
alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, location, occupancy and maintenance of all
buildings and structures, and shall apply to existing or proposed buildings and structures; except as
such matters are otherwise provided for in other ordinances or statutes, or in the rules and regulations
authorized for promulgation under the provisions of this code.

Exception: Non residential farm buildings and structures.
SECTION 104.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

104.1 Code Official: The Department of Permits and Inspections and the Director thereof
shall be known as the Code Official.

ADD THE FOLLOWING SECTION 105.9 WHICH SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

105.9 Withholding of Permits: Whenever the Code Official shall find that any person,
agent, firm or corporation, whether as owner, lessee or occupant, is in violation of the provisions of
this code or of the rules and regulations of any other department or agency of Washington County
in connection with the erection, maintenance, use, or repair of buildings, structures, lands or
equipment thereon or therein, he may refuse to grant any further permits or inspections until all
violations have been corrected and approved.

SECTION 107.1.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

107.11 Repairs: Application or notice to the code official is not required for ordinary
repairs to structures. Such repairs shall not include the cutting away of any wall, partition or portion
thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or loadbearing support, or the removal or
change of ahy required means of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the egress
requirements; nor shall ordinary repairs include addition to, alteration of, replacement or relocation
of any standpipe, water supply, sewer drainage, drain leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping,
electric wiring or mechanical or other work affecting public health or general safety.

Exception: Roof replacements that do not involve the change or replacement of
structural components.

SE_CTION 112.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

112.1 General: A permit to begin work for an approval of part, new construction, alteration,
removal, demolition, or other building operation shall not be issued until the fees prescribed in this
section shall have been paid to the department of building inspection or other authorized agency of
the jurisdiction, nor shall an amendment to a permit necessitating an additional fee be approved until
the additional fee has been paid.



SECTION 112.5 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

112.5 Fee Schedule: A fee for each plan examination, building permit and i mspec‘aon shall
be paid in accordance with the following schedule.

RESIDENTIAL:

Finished area (living space) - $20 plus $.07/sf.
Unfinished areas (basement, crawl space) $.04/sf.
Garages, carports, porches, decks,

swimming pools, chimney and other

accessory structures $20 plus $.04/sf.
Intgerior; exterior alterations, '
repairs and remodeling $20 plus 3.07/sf.
Mobile Homes ' o . $20 plus $.07/sf.
COMMERCIAL/INSTITUTIONAL/INDUSTRIAL:

All floor (new construction or

additions) $75 plus $.07/sf.

Interior alterations $75 plus $.07/sf.
DEMOLITION | $20
" MINIMUM FEE FOR REFUNDS $20

REINSPECTION FEES for condemnation of
work or premature request/change of contractor $20

The apphcatlon fee and review fee of $15.00 per agency will be charged for each
reviewing agency in all cases, including those in which the permit expires, becomes void or is

withdrawn.

Note: All measurements shall be computed using gross exterior building dimensions.

SECTION 113.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:
113.2 Re(juest for Required Inspections: The .permit holder or his agent shall make

inspection requests with the Department of Permits and Inspections at least twenty-four (24) hours
in advance for each phase of construction listed in this section. After issuing a building permit, the

-5-



code official shall conduct inspections from time to time during and upon completion of the work
for which a permit has been issued. A record of all such examinations and inspections and of all
violations of this code shall be maintained by the code official. The owner shall provide for special
inspections in accordance with Section 1705.0.

'ADD SECTION 113.2.3 WHICH SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

- 113.2.3 Footing Inspection: Required after trenches or basement areas are excavated, forms
erected, any required reinforcing steel is in place, and prior to the placing of concrete.,

ADD SECTION 113.2.4 WHICH SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:
113.2.4 Foundation Inspection: Required prior to backfill or framing. |
ADD SECTION 113.2.5 WHICH SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

113.2.5 Framing or Rough Inspection: Required after the roof, all framing, firestopping,
draftstopping and bracing are in place. Rough plumbing, mechanical, electrical and framing
inspection shall be made prior to covering or concealment of work.

ADD SECTION 113.2.6 WHICH SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

113.2.6 Other Inspection: The Building Department may make or require other inspections
to ascertain compliance with this code and other laws enforced by the Building Department.

SECTION 116.4 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

116.4 Violation Penalties: Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements hereof or who shall erect, construct, alter or repair a
building or structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit
or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable
by a fine of not less than Two Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00) or more than One Thousand
Dollars ($1,000.00), or by imprisonment not exceeding one (1) year, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed.

a separate offense.
SECTION 117.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

117.2 Unlawful continuance: Any person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than Two
Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00) or more than One Thousand Dollars (81,000.00) per day.



TTWASHINGTON COUNTY

SECTION 118.4 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

118.4 Contents of certificate: When a structure is entitled thereto, the code official shall
issue a certificate of occupancy within ten days after written application. Upon completion of the
final inspection in accordance with Section 113.3 and correction of the violations and discrepancies,
the certificate of occupancy shall be issued. The certificate of occupancy shall specify the following.

The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.

The use group and occupancy, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3.
The type of construction as defined in Chapter 6. :

If an automatic sprinkler system is provided, whether the sprinkler system is required.
Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit.

“NnhwD -~

. SECTION 121.2.1 5. SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

121.2.1 Qualifications: .

5. Registered design professional with fire protection engineering experience; or a fire
protection contractor with at least ten-years experience, five of which shall have been
in responsible charge of work or a citizen chosen at large who is a citizen of .

Washington County.
SECTION 121.2.6 SHALL READ AS. FOLLOWS:

121.2.6 Compensatlon of members: Members of the Board shall receive Twenty-Five
Dollars ($25.00) for each meetmg

SECTION 305.1.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

, 305.1.1 Day care facilities: A day care facility which provides care for more than eight (8)
persons more than 2 % years of age for less than 24 hours per day shall be classified as Use Group

E.
SECTION 308.3.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

308.3.1 Child care facility: A child care facility which accommodates more than eight (8)
children 2 ¥ years of age or less for any length of time shall be classified as Use Group I-2.

SECTION 310.5.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

310.5.1 Famlly day care: A child care facility which accommodates elght (8) or less
children of any age shall be classified as Use Group R-3. The facility shall comply with all
requirements of the Maryland Child Care Adrmmstranon and the Maryland State Fire Marshall's

Office.



SECTION 707.6.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 707.6.2 Residential occupancies: In occupancies in Usé Group R-2 and R-3, the
~ wall shall be continuous to the underside of the roof sheathing or deck in Types 3, 4 and 5
construction where all of the following conditions are met:

1

2.

4,

5.

The wall is properly fireblocked at the roof sheathing or deck.

The roof sheathing or deck is constructed of approved noncombustible materials or
of fire retardant-treated wood, for a distance of 4 feet (1219 mm) on both sides of the
wall, or such roof sheathing or deck is constructed with 5/8-inch Type X gypsum
board supported directly beneath the underside of the roof sheathing or deck, using
minimum 2-inch ledgers attached to the sides of the roof framing members, for a
minimum distance of 4 feet (1219 mm) on both sides of the fire wall.

Exception: The requirement concerning roof sheathing materials and deck does
not apply to sprinklered buildings.

Combustible material does not extend through the .wall.
The roof covering has a minimum of a Class C rating.

Openings in the roof shall not be located within 5 feet (1524 mm) of the fire wall.

SECTION 1005.5 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

1005.5 Open-sided walkmg areas: Guards shall be located along open-sided walking
surfaces, mezzanines, stairways, ramps and landings which are located more than 30 inches above
the floor or grade below. The guards shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1021.0.

) Exception: Guards are not ‘req‘uired for the following locations:

1.

On the loading side of loading docks.
On the auditorium side of stages and raised platforms.
On raised stage and platform floor areas such as runways, ramps and side stages

~ utilized for entertainment or presentations.

At vertical openings in the performance area of stages and platforms. - ,
At elevated walking surfaces appurtenant to stages and platforms for access to and
utilization of special lighting or equipment.

SECTION 1005.5.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

1005.5.1 Screen porches: Porches and decks which are enclosed with insect screening shall
be provided with guards in accordance with Section 1021.0 where the walking surface is located
more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below.

-8-



SECTION 1014.6 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section:1014.6 Treads and risers: Maximum riser height shall be 7 inches (178 mm) and
minimum riser height shall be 4 inches (102 mm). The riser height shall be measured vertically
between the leading edges of the adjacent treads. Minimum tread depth shall be 11 inches (279
mm), measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads

and ata right angle to the tread’s leading edge.

Excebﬁons:

1.

2.

- Winders in accordance with Section 1014.6.3.

Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1014.6.4.

Circular srairways in accordance with Section 1014.6.5.
Alternating tread stairways in accordance with Section 1014.6.6.

Stairways serving as aisles in assembly seating areas where the stairway pitch or
slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the slope of the adjacent seating area.

Any srairway replacing an existing stairway within a space where, because of
existing construction, the pitch or slope cannot be reduced. '

Existing stairways.

In occupancies of Use Group R-3 and in Use Group U, which are accessory to an

occupancy in Use Group 3, the maximum riser height shall be 8 1/4 inches (210 mm)
and the minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (229 mm). '

" Within dwelling units of Use Group R-2, the maximum riser height shall be 8"‘inches

(203 mm) and the minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (229 mm).

A nosing not less than 3/4 inch (19 mm) but not more than 1 1/4 inches (32 mm)
shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread depth is less than 11

* inches (279 mm).

SECTION 1022.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

1022.2 Handrail details: Handrails shall be continuous, without interruption by newel posts,
other structure elements or obstructions. A handrail and any wall or other surface adjacent to the
handrail shall be free of any sharp or abrasive elements and shall be in compliance with the

Maryland Accessibility Code.



SECTION 1806.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

~ 1806.1 Frost Protection: Except where erected upon solid rock or otherwise protected from
frost, foundation walls, piers and other permanent supports of all buildings and structures larger than
200 square feet (18.60 mm) in area or 10 feet (3048 mm) in height shall extend to the frost line of
the locality, and spread footings of adequate size shall be provided where necessary to distribute
properly the load within the allowable loadbearing value of the soil. Alternatively, such structures
shall be supported on piles where solid earth or rock is not available. Footings shall not bear on
frozen soils unless such frozen condition is of a permanent character. The frost line depth for
Washington County is hereby established as being thirty (30) inches below finished grade for

building footings.

THE FIRST PARAGRAPH OF SECTION 3408.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:
3408.2 Applicability: Structures existing prior to January 1, 1972, in which there is work

involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy, shall be made to conform to the
requirements of this section or the provisions of Sections 3403.0 through 3407.0.

SECTION 4. SAVING CLAUSE

Nothing in this Ordinance or in the building code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect |
any suit or proceeding impending 1n any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any
cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under an.y act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited
in Section 2 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legai. right or remedy of any character be lost,

| impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

- Adopted this fl’h‘-day of __ ( };inﬁg A _, 1997.
Effective the _]fhdayof __ (Dcdnlio . , 1997.

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
~ F WASHINGTON COYTY
Joni L. Bittner, Clerk Gregory I. Snook, P\esident

/gﬂf,/W

Gj%w DO

Ronald L. Bowers v

-10-



Approved as to form
and legal sufficiency:

~

Beth L. Evans
Assistant County Attorney

Mail to:
County Attorney's Office
100 W. Washington Street, Room 213
‘Hagerstown, MD 21740

HAORDINANC\BLDGCODE'BOCABLE.96

1017197

-11-



e

{E CIRC URT
~LERK OF THE CIRCUIT €O
: TOH COUHTY
ACTS, ’.“?"J:s‘*l!\!\‘CE”S & ¥ ASHINGT
RESOLUTIONS - CCUNTY

AN.ORDINANCE TO REPEAL THE 1992 CABO ONE AND TWO FAMILY
) DWELLING CODE AND TO ENACT THE - ,
1995 FIRST PRINTING OF THE CABG ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLING CODE,
WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Ma.rylaﬁd, being
concémed with providing minimum standards for the protection of life, limb, health, property,
envifonment and for the safety and welfare of the consumer, general public, and owners and
occupants of residential buildings in Washington County, adopted on May 31, 1994, the 1992 CABO -
Oneé and Two Family Dwelling Code; and |

WHEREAS, it has been recommended to the County Commissioners of Washington County,

- Maryland, that it adopt the 1995 First Printing of the CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code

which is more up-to-date and which provides greater safeguards for residents of Washington County,

Maryland; and
WHEREAS, a public hearihg was held on September 23, 1997, following dﬁe notice and

advertisement of the text of the 1995 First Printing of the CABO One and Two Family Dwelling

Code, with amendments for Washington County: and

WHEREAS, public comment was received. reviewed and considered concerning the repeal
of the 1992 CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code. with amendments, and the adoption of the

1995 First Printing of the CABO One and Two Famuly Code. with local amendments for Washington

Count'f :



CLERK O
S

R
Y/ A
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED that the 1992 CABO One and

Two Family Dwelling Code, with amendments, adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of

Washington County on May 31, 1994 and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict

herewith are hereby repealed; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED that the 1995 First Printing of
the CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code, the contents of which are incorporated herein by
reference, is enacted with the following insertions, amendments and additions:

(1)  "AMEND SECTION 104.1 - GENERAL to read as follows:
" SECTION 104 - AUTHORITY

Section 104.1 - General: The Director of the Department of Permits and Inspections shall
be known as the Code Official and is hereby authorized and directed to administer and enforce all

~ the provisions of this Code.
2) AMEND SECTION 106.4 PENALTY to read as follows:

Section 106.4 Penalty: Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of
this code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate
offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisioris
of this code is committed, continued or permitted, and upon convictions of any such violation such
person shall be punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 or less than $250.00 per day or by
imprisonment or by both such fine and imprisonment as established by local applicable laws.

(3) AMEND SECTION 111.2 PERMIT FEES to read as follows:

. Section 111.2 Permit Fees: Building permit fees shall be based on the square footage area
of proposed structure(s) and include an application fee as follows:

Application Fee: $20.00 :
Finished Areas .07 per square foot for finished areas
Unfinished Areas_ | - .06 per square foot for unfinished area

(4)  ADD SECTION 111.5 WITHHOLDING OF PERMITS to read as follows:
Section 111.5 Withholding of Permits: Whenever the code official shall find that any

person, agent, firm or corporation, whether as owner, lessee, sub-lessee or occupant, is in violation
of the provisions of this Code or the rules and regulations of any other department or agency of

2-



Washington County in connection with the erection, maintenance, use, or repair of buildings,
structures, lands or equipment thereon or therein, he may refuse to grant any further permits or
1nspect10ns until all violations have been corrected and approved.

(%) AMEND SECTIONS 113.1, 113.1.1 THRU 113.1.5 REQUEST FOR REQUIRED
INSPECTIONS AND DELETE SECTION 113.1.6. Sections 113.1, 113.1.1 through 113.1.5
will be aménded to read as follows:

Section 113.1 Request for Required Inspection: The permit holder or his agent shall make
inspection requests with the Department of Permits and Inspections at least twenty-four (24) hours -
in advance for each phase of construction listed in this section. After inspection, the building official
shall either approve that portion of the construction as completed or shall notify the permit holder

or his agent wherein the same fails to comply with this Code.

Section 113.1.1 Footer Inspection: Required after trenches or basement areas afe exéavated,
forms érected, any required reinforcing steel is in place and prior to the placing of concrete.

Section 113.1.2 Foundation Inspection: Required prior to backfill or framing.

Section 113.1.3 Framing or Rough Inspection: Required after the roof, all framing, fire
stopping, draft stopping and bracing are in place. Rough plumbing, mechanical, electrical, and
framing inspections shall be made prior to covering or concealment of work.

Section 113.1.4 Final Bulldmg Inspection:’ Requlred after plumbmg, electrical, and
‘mechanical mspectlons are completed and prior to occupancy.

Section 113.1.5 Other Inspections: In addition to the called inspections above, the building
department may make or require any other inspections to ascertain compliance with this Code and
~ other laws enforced by the building department. The code official may impose a reinspection fee

for condemnation of work, building not accessible or premature inspection request.

(6) DELETE SECTION 115.1 IN ITS ENTIRETY



- U A U T -
s OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ERK O INETON COUNTY

@) AMEND TABLE 301.2a AS SHOWN BELOW:
Table No. 301.2a

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

ROOF LIVE ROOF SNOW WIND SEISMIC SUBJECT TO SUBJECT TO WINTER DESIGN?
LOAD! LOAD' PRESSURE!* CONDITION DAMAGE FROM? DAMAGE TEMP. FOR
(Lbs per (Lbs. Per (Lbs per BY - FROM® HTG. FACILITIES
Sq. Ft.) Sq. Ft.) Sq. Ft.) ZONE

Frost Line
Weathering | Depth Termite
Decay
30 35 18 0 ‘Severe 30 Moderate 12
to
Heavy

! Roof live and snow loads are not additive.

? Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy structural
requirements of this code. The weathering column shall be filled in with the weathering index (i.e., “negligible”,
“moderate”,-or “severe”) for concrete as determined from the Weathering Probability Map in Appendix A. The grade of
masoriry units shall be determined from ASTM C34, C55, C62, C73, C90, C129, C145, C216, or C652 listed in Section
S-26.201. The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure No. R-403.1a. The jurisdiction
shall fill in the frost line depth column with “yes” or “no” including minimum depth of footing below finish grade..

? The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “yes” or “no” depending on whether there has been a history of
local damage. '

* The jurisdiction shall fill in this bortion of the table with wind design loads determined from the Wind Probability Map
in Appendix .- A, or ASCE 7 listed in Section S-26-201.
5 If heating facilities are not required in this climate enter “None Required.”




(8) AMEND TABLE 301.4 AS SHOWN BELOW:

TABLE 301.4
MINIMUM UNIFORMLY DISTRIBUTED LIVE LOADS
(in pounds per square foot -- 1b./ft.?)

LIVE

USE LOAD
Balconies (exterior 60
Decks 60
Fire Escapes 40
Gara_ges (passenger cars only) 50
Attics (no storage with roof slope not steeper than 3 in 12) 10
Attics (limited attic storage) 20
Dwelling units (except ‘sleepixig rooms) 40
Sleeping Rooms V 30
Stairs 40!
] Gu;rd.raxls and Handrails (A single concentrated load applied in any direction at any point along the 200

top :

jor S1: 1 psf=0.0479kN/m?, 1 square inch - 645 mm?.
" Individual stair treads shall be designed for the uniformly distributed live load or a 300-pound concentrated load acting over an

area  of 4 square inches, whichever produces the greater stresses.
9 AMEND SECTION 309.2 SEPARATION REQUIRED to read as follows:

Section 309.2 Separation ReQuired The garage shall be separated from the residence and its
attic area by means of minimum »2-inch (12.7 mm) gypsum board applied to the garage side. Garages
under habitable areas to be separated by 1-hour fire rated assemblies. : .

(10) - AMEND SECTION 309.3 FLOOR SURFACE to read as follows:

Section 309.3 Floor Surface: Garage and carport ﬂoor surfaces shall be of approved~
noncombustible material. That area of floor used for parking of automobiles or other vehicles shall be
sloped to facilitate the movement of liquids to a drain or toward the main vehicles entry doorway.

Maintain a 4 inch step down from floor level of dwelling to the garage.



Juyuuo Vviu4gld
- HE CIRCUIT COURT
LE&&?&!L TON COUNTY

SECTION 312 - LANDINGS

(11) AMEND SECTION 312.1(2) GENERAL to read as follows:

Section 312.1 General: A minimum of 3 foot by 3 foot (914 mm by 914 mm) landing shall be
required on each side of an egress door. The floor or landing shall not be more than 1 ¥ inches (38

mm) lower than the top of the threshold.

Exceptions:
1. At the top of a flight of stairs, provided the door does not swing over the stairs
2. The landing at the exterior doorway shall not be more than 8 ¥; inches below the top of

the threshold, provided the door does not swing over the landing. -

3. Exterior storm and screen doors are exempt from the requirements for landings.

(12) AMEND SECTION 314.2 TREADS AND RISERS to read as follows:

Section 314.2 Treads and Risers: The maximum riser height shall be 8 1/4 inches and the
minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches. The riser height shall be measured vertically between leading
edges of the adjacent treads. The tread depth shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes
of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. The
walking surface of treads and landings of a stairway shall be sloped no steeper than one unit vertical in
48 units horizontal (2-percent slope). The greatest riser height within any flight of stairs shall not
exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm). The greatest tread depth within any ﬂlght of stairs
shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inches (9.5 mm).

(13) AMEND SECTION 315.1 H.A.NDRAILS to read as follows:

. Section 315 1 Handrails: Handrails having muumurn and maximum he1ghts of 30 inches and
38 inches (762 mm and 965 mm), respectively, measured vertically from the nosing of the treads, shall
be provided on at least one side of stairways of four or more risers. Spiral stairways shall have the
required handrail located on the outside radius. All required handrails shall be continuous the full
length of the stairs. Ends shall be returned or shall terminate in newel posts or safety terminals.
Handrails adjacent to a wall shall have a space of not less than 1 % inches (38 mm) between the wall

" and the handrail.

Exceptions:
L. Handrails shall be permitted to be interrupted by a newel post ata turn.
2. The use of a volute, turnout or starting easing shall be allowed over the lowest tread.

-6-



(14) AMEND SECTION 315.4 GUARDRAIL OPENING LIMITATIONS to read as follows:

Section 315.4 Guardrail Opening Limitations: Required guardrails on open sides of
stairways, raised floor areas, balconies and porches shall have intermediate rails or omamental closures

which do not allow passage of an object 6 inches or more in diameter.

(15) AMEND SECTION 316.1 SMOKE DETECTORS REQUIRED to read as follows:

Section 316.1 Smoke Detectors Required: Smoke detectors shall be installed outside of each
separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms and on each additional story of the
dwelling, including basements and cellars but not including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In
dwellings or dwelling units with split levels, a smoke detector needs to be installed only on the upper
level, provided the lower level is less than one full story below the upper level, except that if there is
a door between levels then a detector is required on each level. All detectors shall be interconnected
such that the actuation of one alarm will actuate all the alarms in the individual unit and shall provide
an alarm which will be audible in all sleeping areas. All detectors shall be approved and listed and shall

be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions.

When alterations, repairs or additions requiring a permit occur, or when one or more sleeping
rooms are added or created in existing dwellings, the entire building shall be provided with smoke
detectors located as required for new dwellings; the smoke detectors are not required to be
interconnected unless other remodeling considerations require removal of the appropriate wall and

ceiling coverings to facilitate concealed interconnected wiring.
6) DELETE SECTION 324 PROTECTION AGAINST RADON in its entirety.

(177 DELETE SECTIONS 403.1 THROUGH FIG. 403.3b AND ADD SECTION 403.1
FOOTINGS to read as follows: )

SECTION 403 - FOOTINGS

~ Section 403.1 Footings: All exterior walls, bearing walls, columns and piers shall be supported
on continuous solid masonry or concrete footings, wood foundations, or other approved structural .
systems which shall be of sufficient design to support safely the loads imposed as determined from the
character of the soil, and except when erected upon solid rock or otherwise protected from frost, shall
extend below the frost line, Minimum sizes for concrete footings shall be as set forth in Figure
No.403.2. Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth in Sections

404.2, Figures 403.16 and 403. le.

The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of fooﬁhgs may have a slope not
exceeding the elevation of the top surface of the footings or where the slope-of the bottom surface of

the footing will exceed 1 in 10.

-7-



Exception: Footings are not required to be stepped or continuous where changes of footing
elevations exceeds 4 ft. Such footing can be connected by masonry lintels with a minimum 18
inches of bearing on steel reinforced footings. :

(18) AMEND TABLE 403.1a AS SHOWN BELOW:

[See Next Page]



[RIAVAYA ] N Figure 403.13-

MINIMUM FOUNDATION REQUIREMENTS

NE
-

t%/!r vs::aous @ ¢ 0.C. é ;
312" MIN.
= e b | e
A N .
-y
'}

g" . UNOISTURBED .
, , NATURAL GRADE

E z 4 9‘ e

- P ERTRON / \ -4

b L . - 12 . 1 STORY

w 15" . 2$TORY
e = - 1 . 3STOAY |
EXTERION INTERION
CONCRETE SLAS FLOOTING

UNTREATED SILL " THICK, WIDTH

w NOT LESS THAN STUDS o
& e | MORE THAN 177 FROM CORNER A | e " FINISHED
g w3 4" MIN. S ) UNDISTURSED
T AF £\ /NATURAL
@ e 3@ ANDBELOW __, GRADE
€ : FROST LINE a’)
Q .l . . _'.: .
5 yaun 14=.6" POURED ]
i — I6 - 8" POURED !
g MaAX3 187 *10" POURED"
INTERIOR OR EXTERIOR 20" -12” POURED EXTERIOR BEARING
BEARING WALL FOQTINGS WALL FOOTING
7 480LTS @ 6° 0.C. 15" IN
MASONARY NOT MORE THAN
12" FROM COANER
3 MASONAY
_ v
UNCER-FLOOR SPACE :
i . S - UNOER-FLOOR SPACE
"
BELOW FRQST o 4 MIN.
A BN UNE MiN3g | T {- 803
BRI DI 07\ o SVERS S
At BN b I Rt Bl O
EE TASLE ,
NO.A-602.2.1b ¥
QOTING 34 .
INTERIOR PIER F 02 8 mLock INTERIOR OR EXTERIOR
18" 10"8LaCK BEARING WALL FOOTINGS
20% 12" Bocx

NOTES: :
'Foundatons shall extend not less than 12 inches beiow the fnished natural grade or engineered

Ml in nocase less than the irost ine depth. , . .
2Footing sizes are based on sod with an allowable sod pressure of 2,000 pounds per square foot.

Footings on soil with a lower alowable sod pressure shal be designed in accordance
with accepled engineering pracocs.
IFoatng projections shall not exceed the footng thickness.

-9-



00008 010391

5 F THE C:20UIT COURT
LK QRINGTON COURTY

(19) AMEND TABLE 404.1.1a as shown below:

TABLE 404.1.1a
MINIMUM THICKNESS AND ALLOWABLE DEPTH OF UNBALANCED FILL FOR
UNREINFORCED MASONRY AND CONCRETE FOUNDATION WALLS'? WHERE
UNSTABLE SOIL OR GROUNDWATER CONDITIONS DO NOT EXIST IN SEISMIC
ZONES O,10R2 :

'NOMINAL THICKNESS® MAXIMUM DEPTH OF
FOUNDATION WALL CONSTRUCTION - (inches) UNBALANCED FILL!
‘ (feet)
Masonry of Hollow Units, Ungrouted 8 4
10 5
12 7
Masonry of Solid Units 6 3
: 8 5
10 6
_ 12 7
Masonry of Hollow or Solid Units, Fully Grouted : 8 7
' . 10 8
12 8
Plain Concrete 6 6
8 7
10 8
12 8
Rubble Stone Masonry : ' 16
Masonry of hollow units reinforced with No 4 bars 8 7
. and grout at 24 inches on center. Bars located
not less than 4 ¥ inches from pressure side of .
wall.

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm. | foot - 304.8 mm. : :
! Unbalanced fill is the difference in height of the exterior and intenor finish ground levels. Where an interior concrete slab is

grovided, the unbalanced fill shall be measured from the exterior finish ground level to the top of the interior concrete slab.

The height between lateral supports shall not exceed 8 feet. .
3 The actual thickness shall not be more than % inch less than the required nominal thickness specified in the table.

4 Six-inch plan concrete walls shall be formed on both sides.

-10-



(20) AMEND SECTION 406.1 CONCRETE AND MASONRY FOUNDATION
DAMPPROOFING AND DELETE SECTIONS 406.2 THROUGH 406.3.5. SECTION 406.1
CONCRETE AND MASONRY FOUNDATION DAMPPROOFING to read as follows:

Section 406.1 Concrete and Masonry Foundation Dampproofing: Exterior foundation walls
of masonry construcnon enclosing basements shall be dampproofed by applying not less than 3/8 inch
of portland cement parging to the wall from footing to finish grade. The parging shall be covered with
a coat of approved bituminous material applied at the recommended rate. Exterior foundation walls of
concrete construction enclosing basements shall be dampproofed by applying a coat of approved
bituminous material to the wall from the footing to the finish grade at the recommended rate.

Foundation walls of habitable rooms located below grade shall be waterproofed with membranes
extending from the edge of the footing to the finish grade line. The membrane shall consist of 2-ply
hot-mopped felts, 6-mil polyvinyl chloride, 55-pound roll roofing or equivalent material. The laps in .

the waterproofing membrane shall be sealed and firmly affixed to the wall.

Foundation wa.lls may be dampproofed or waterproofed‘ using materials or methods of
construction other than covered in this section where approved by the building official.

(21) AMEND SECTION 505.2.3 VAPOR BARRIER to read as follows:

.Section 505.2.3 Vapor Barrier: An approved vapor barrier with jdints lapped not less than 6
inches (153 mm) shall be placed between the concrete floor slab and the base course or the prepared

- subgrade where no base course exists.

Exception: The vapor barrier may be omitted:

1. From detached émages, utility buildings and other unheated accessory structures;

2. From driveway, walks, patios and other flatwork not likely to be enciosed and heated
at a later date; ’

3. Where approved by the code official, based on local site conditions; or

4. From unheated attached garages.

(22) DELETE SECTION 604.2.3 INITS ENTIRETY.
(23) AMEND SECTION 703.7.4 WEEPHO.LES to read as follows:

Section 703.7.4 Weepholes: Weepholes shall be provided in the outside wythe of masonry walls
at a maximum spacing of 4 feet on center. Weepholes shall not be less than 3/16 inch (4.8 mm) in

diameter. Weepholes shall be located immediately above the flashing.

-11-



JUuUuog Uluov
OF THE CI2CUIT COURT
LE&«’E& HINGTGHN COUNTY

(24) AMEND SECTION 910.3(3) RECOVERING VS. REPLACEMENT to read as follows:

Section 910.3 Recovering vs. Replacement: New roof covering shall not be installed without
first removing existing roof coverings when any of the following conditions occur. :

1) When the existing roof or roof covering is water soaked or deteriorated to the point of
being unacceptable as a base for additional roofing.

2. When the existing roof covering is wood shake, slate, clay or cement tile; except when
the new roof covering is installed in accordance with approved industry standards.

3. When the existing roof has two or more layers of any type of roofing.

Exception: The removal of existing roof coverings shall not be required where complete and
separate roofing systems are provided which transmit all roof loads directly to the structure system of

the building and which do not bear upon the 'existing roof.

(25) AMEND SECTION 1006 EXTERIOR AIR SUPPLY to read as follows:
SECTION 1006 - AIR SUPPLY

(26) AMEND SECTION 1006.1 EXTERIOR AIR to read as follows:

Section 1006.1 Air: Factory-built or masonry 'ﬁreplacés covered in this chapter shall be
equipped with an air supply to assure proper fuel combustion.

(27) DELETE THE FOLLOWING CHAPTERS AND APPENDICES:

Chapter 26 : Chapter 38
Chapter 29 Chapter 39
Chapter 30 Chapter 40
Chapter 31 Chapter 41
Chapter 32 . Chapter 42
Chapter 33 : _ Chapter 43
Chapter 34 - Chapter 44
Chapter 35 Chapter 45
Chapter 36 Chapter 46
Chapter 37 - :
Appendix B Appendix D
Appendix C Appendix F

Adopted this "H™day of ,1997.
Effective the _‘hday of _, 1997

-12-



SLERK OF THE CI2CUIT COURT
WASHINGTGN COUNTY
ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
. OF WASHINGTON C UNl E
Joni L. Bittner, Clerk Gregory L. ook re51dent
Qm Vlce‘ges‘ii}@\)\
@ 20
Ronald L. Bowers
/f (o Uiy
) Lee 7 W
- (1 2¢
Jam@ﬁ. ‘Wade
Approved as to form and
- legal sufﬁcienc;y:
Beth L. Evans |
Issistant County Attorney
Mail to:
County Attorney's Office

100 W. Washington Street, Room 213
Hagerstown, MD 21740

10/7/97

H:AORDINANC\CABO1&2\CABO-95.WPD

-13-



-

-

UUyUuo Ui ugd
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
WASHINGTON CO OUNTY

ACTS, ORDINANCES &
RESOLUTIONS - COUNTY

AN'ORDINANCE TO REPEAL THE 1993 BOCA NATIONAL MECHANICAL
CODE, EIGHTH EDITION AND TO ENACT »
THE 1996 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICALCODE, FIRST PRINTING
WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners, of Washington County, Maryland being
concerned with providing protecuon for the consumer, general public, and owners and occupants of

buildings and structures in Washington County, Maryland, adopted on April 26, 1994, the 1993

BOCA National Mechanical Code, Ei}hﬂﬁdition, with local amendments for Washington County;

/

and

- WHEREAS, it has been recommended to the County Commissioners of Washington County,

: Maryland, that it adopt the 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, which is more up-to-

date and which provides greater safeguards for the consﬁmer, general public, owners and occupants
of buildings and structures in Washington County; and prbvides for minimum regulations governing
the design, installation and construction of mechaniqal systems; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on September 23, 1997, following due notice and
advertisement of the text of the 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, with local
amendmenfs for Washington County; and |

WHEREAS, public comment was‘ received. reviewed and considered concerning the repeal
of the 1993 BOCA National Mecham'cal Code, in ghth Editiokn, with amendments, and the adoption

of the 1996 International Mechanical Code, First Printing, with local amendments for Washington

County.



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
-Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, that the 1993 BOCA National Mechanical Code,
Eighth Edition, with amendments, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinancés 1n conflict herewith
are hereby repealed; and
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
Comisioners of Washington County, Maryland, that the 1996 International Mechanical Code, First

Printing, the contents of which are incorporated herein by reference, be and is enacted with the

following insertions, amendments, and additions:

N

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

* ok ok k k k k k k k k k

(I)  SECTION 101.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shal.l be known as the Mechanical Code of
Washington County, Maryland, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.
(2) SECTION 103.' 1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 103.1 General. The Director of the Department of Permits and Inspections of
Washington County shall be known as the Code Official.
(3)  SECTION 106.5.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 106.5.2 Fee Schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as indicated in the
following schedule:
[NOT APPLICABLE] |
(4)  SECTION 106.5.3 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 106.5.3 Fee Refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as
follows:



SLERK OF THE C!IRZUIT COURT
YW ASHIMGTOM COUNTY
1. All but the application fee hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.
2. All but the application fee when no work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written
application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

(5) SECTION 108.4 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code
or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
rmsdemeanor punishable by a fine of not less than $250.00 or not more than $1,000.00 or by

imprisonment not exceeding one year, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

(6) SECTION 108.5 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders. Upon notice from the code official that mechanical work
is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work
shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the
property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the
conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official
shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall
continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop work order, except such work
as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a

fine of not less than $250.00 or more than $1,000.00.
@) CHAPTER 16 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

Section 16 Referenced Standards

COD E S This model mechanical code is intended to be utilized in conjunction with the other model codes that are adopted by the jurisdiction.

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number

BOCA National Building Code/1996  201.3, 202, 301.12, 301.14, 302.1, 304.5, 304.8, 308.9, 401.4, 401,8, 402.4,
404.1, 504.2, 506.6, 506.12, 510.6.1, 510.6.2, 510.7, 511.1.5, 602.1, 603.11, 603.14

604.4, 606.2.1, 607.1, 607.2, 607.3, 607.7, 703.2.1, 703.2.2, 801.3, 801.17.1, 902.1,

911.3,911.4,913.3,1004.6, 1105.3, 1106.5, 1206.4, 1401.2.2, 1502.3, 1502.3.1

BOCA National Fire Prevention Code/1996 201.3, 502.4, 502.8, 509.6, 510.4, 1301.2, 1401.1, 1401.2, 1401.2.1



Juuuao uUiluao

- OF THE CIRCUIT COURT .
LE&JKASHlNGTOH COUNT

(8)  SECTION 4. SAVING CLAUSE

That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Mechanical Code hereby adopted shall be construed
to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred,
or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed in
this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or
affected by this Ordinance. :

Adopted this 7~ day of __chbb_g_\_z_, 1997.
Effective the 77A<day of __ ¢( }:itbg A, 1997.

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
F WASHINGTOQI wnAND
Joni L. Bittner, Clerk Gregory\\)Snoo Premdent

Approved as to form

and legal sufficiency:
Beth L. Evans

Assistant County Attorney

Mail to:
County Attorney's Office
100 W. Washington Street, Room 213

Hagerstown, MD 21740
H:\ORDINANC\MECHCODE\MECH96.WPD

10/7/97



AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS
ARISING FROM THE STORAGE, HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES,
MATERIALS AND DEVICES, AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR
PROPERTY IN THE OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES, KNOWN AS THE FIRE
PREVENTION CODE; AND REPEALING THE 1990 BOCA NATIONAL FIRE PREVENTION
CODE ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF WASHINGTON
COUNTY, MARYLAND, ON SEPTEMBER 24, 1991

BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington

County, Maryland, as follows:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF FIRE PREVENTION CODE. |

That "The BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, Ninth Edition, 1993", as published by
the Building Officials and Code Administrators Intemational, Inc., be and is hereby adopted as
the Fire Prevention Code of Washington County, Maryland; for the control of buildings,
structures and premises as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions,
penalties, conditions and terms of the said BOCA National Fire Prevention Code are hereby
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the

additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 3 of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. INCONSISTENT ORDINANCES REPEALED.
That the 1990 BOCA National Fire Prevention Code and all other ordinances or parts

of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 3. ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES.

That the following sections are hereby revised as follows:




(1) SECTION F-101.1 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:
F-101.1 Title: These regulations shall be known as the Fire Prevention Code of Washington

County, Maryland, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

SECTION 4. ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITS.
That the limits referred to in Section F-3003.2 of the BOCA National Fire Prevention
Code/1993 in which the storage of explosive materials is prohibited are hereby established as

follows: Washington County, Maryland.

SECTION 5. SAVING CLAUSE

That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Fire Prevention Code hereby adopted shall be
construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or
liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal

right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinancs.

SECTION 6. DATE OF EFFECT.
That this Ordinance shall take full force and effect upon adoption by the Board of

County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland.

Adopted and effective this sth-day of Q,‘WJ , 1994,

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

OE-WASHINGTON UNTY, MARYLAND

Joni L. Bittner, Clerk

ichard E. Roulette, President




Mail to:

Ralph H. France, Il
County Attomey

100 W. Washington Street
Hagerstown, MD 21740

Ronald L. Bowers, Vice President

aimwmwcw

Linda C. Irvin-Craig

“John S. Shank




WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland,
being concemed with safety and fire prevention in Washington County, adopted the 1990
National Electrical Code on July 31, 1990; and

WHEREAS, it has been recommended to the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County, Maryland, that it adopt the 1993 National Electrical Code which is more
up-to-date and which provides greater electrical safeguards for residents of Washington
County, Maryland, if implemented; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on April 26, 1994 following due notice and
advertisement of the text of the 1993 National Electrical Code; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED that the 1990 National Electrical Code adopted
by the Board of Cc;unty Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, on July 31, 1990 and
all other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewtih are hereby repealed; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED that the 1993 National Electrical Code is

enacted as follows:

SEE ATTACHED

p_?.
F



Adopted and effective this _JL:h~ day of

ATTEST:

‘:(:\Ll\ \—— %M A

Joni L. Bittner, Clerk * '

Approved as to legal
su_fﬁciency:

/
IR N
Ralph H. France, I
County Attorney

Mail to:

Ralph H. France, i
County Attomey

i00 W. Washington Street
Hagerstown, MD 21740 .

Concd ., 19904,

]

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF W.A—.SH!NGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND

-Linda C. lrvin—Craig
.7

‘\dohn S. Shank

g b A Q\AMQ{

Gregory, |. Sno\k o

i
¢
i




LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY
TO THE
2002 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

(Note: new language is in bold Italics)

ARTICLE 210 - BRANCH CIRCUITS, is amended as follows:

Section 210.8 Ground-Fault Circuit-Interrupter*Protection for Personal, Subsection (a)
Dwelling Units, Is amended by adding Subsection (9) which shall read as follows:

(9) Receptacles within 6 feet of the outside edge of the laundry sink / tub.

Exception: A single receptacle dedicated for one appliance or a duplex
receptacle with dedicated outlets for two appliances such as pumps, water heaters,
washers, and dryers. :

Section 210.52 Dwelling Unit Receptacle Outlets, Subsection (g) Basements and
Garages, Is amended and shall read as follows:

(g) Basement and Garages. For a one family dwelling, at least one receptacle outlet, in
addition to any provided for laundry equipment, shall be installed in each basement and
each attached garage, and in each detached garage with electric power. The receptacle
outlets located in each attached and each detached garage with electric power shall be
installed at a minimum height of 18 inches above the finished garage floor. See
Section 210.8 (a)(2) and (a)(5). Where a portion of the basement is finished into one or
more habitable rooms, each separate unfinished portion shall have a receptacle outlet
installed in accordance with this section.

ARTICILE 250 — GROUNDING, is amended as follows:

Section 250.53  Grounding Electrode System Installation, Subsection (a) Rod, Pipe and
Plate Electrodes, are amended by adding Subsection (1) which shall read as follows:

(1) The use of two 8 foot x 5/8 inch galvanized ground rods spaced a minimum of 6
foot apart shall be required for all new and upgraded residential electrical services.
In addition to the two ground rods the use of footer grounds will be left to the
electrician’s preferences.

PAGE 1



LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY
TO THE
2002 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

ARTICLE 300 - WIRING METHODS, is amended as follows:

Section 300.5.d Protection from Damage, Subsection (3) is amended and shall read as
follows:

(3) All Underground Conductors. Under ground conductors that are not encased in
concrete and that are buried below grade shall have their location identified by a
warning ribbon that is placed in the trench at least 12 inches above the underground

installation.

ARTICLE 310 - CONDUCTORS FOR GENERAL WIRING, is amended as follows:

Section 310.15. Ampacities for Conductors Rated 0-2000 volts. Subsection (E) Tables,

Subsection (2), Adjustment Factors, is amended By adding Subsection (c), which reads as

fellows;

(¢c) Cables through framing members. In residential application, cables passing
through framing members shall be limited to no more than 9 cables per each 1%
inch minimum bored hole, not to exceed a total circuit ampacity of 180.

ARTICLE 334 - Nonmetallic - Sheathed Cables; TYPES, NM, NMC, and NMS, is amended as
follows:

Section 334.30 Securing and Supporting. Nonmetallic — sheathed cables shall be secured
by insulated staples, cable ties, straps, hangers, or similar fittings designed and installed
50 as not to damage the cable at intervals not exceeding 4 % feet and within 12 inches of
every cabinet, box or fitting. Flat cables shall not be stapled on edge.

PAGE 2



LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY
TO THE
2002 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

ARTICLE 680 — SWIMMING POOLS, FOUNTAINS, AND SIMILAR INSTALLATIONS, is
amended as follows:

Section 680.5 Ground —Fault Circuit Interrupters

Ground-fault circuit interrupters (GFCIs) shall be self-contained units, circuit breaker or

receptacle types, or other listed types. GFCI protection shall be provided for all wiring
supplying any pool pump rated 15 and 20 amperes, 125 volt and 240 volt, single phase,
whether by receptacle or direct connection.

PAGE 3



uyuug Uluga
SLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

S, ORD!NANCES-& WASHINGTON CO
Ré.g(r)LUTiONS - COUNTY

AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL THE 1993 BOCA NATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
WITH AMENDMENTS ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND AS THE WASHINGTON COUNTY
PLUMBING ORDINANCE ON APRIL 26, 1994 AND TO ENACT THE 1997
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR

WASHINGTON COUNTY _

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland,
being concerned with securing the proper installation of systems for furnishing potable water for
sanitary sewage disposal and storm drainage and to ensure public safety, health and welfare '
insofar as they are affected by regulating and controlling the design, construction, quality of
materials, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to use or
maintenance of plumbing systems, adopted the 1993 BOCA National Plumbing Code with
amendments on April 26, 1994; and

WHEREAS, it has been recommended to the Board of County Commissioners that they
adopt the 1997 International Plumbing Code, First Edition, which is more up-to-date and which
provides'greater safeguards for residents of Washington County, Maryland, if irnplem.énted; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held on September 23, 1997, following due notice and
advertisement of the text of the 1997 International Plumbing Code, First Edition, with certain
requested inserﬁons and revisions; and

WHEREAS, public comment was received, reviewed and considered concerning the
repeal of the 1993 BOCA National Plumbing Code and the adoption of the 1997 International

Plumbing Code, First Edition, including Chapters 1 through 15, Appendix B and C, and local

amendment. _ : R



[V IRV R [ I B O W)

SLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
LEWKASHIHGTOH COUNTY

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained and enacted that the 1993 BOCA Plumbing Codej
with amendments, adopted as the Plumbing Code of Washiﬁgton County, Maryland on April 26,
1994, and all other ordinan;es or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are repealed; and
| _NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained and enacted that the 1997 internétional Plumbing
Code, First Edition, the contents of which are incorporated herein by reference, is enacted with

the following insertions, amendments, and additions:

d ok G ok ok ok ok kK ok

The following sections, tables and appendix are hereby deleted, amended or added:

Section 101.1 Amended Section 404.1-404.34 Deleted
Section 103 Amended Section 404.1 Amended
Section 103.1 Amended Section 412.4 Amended
Section 103.2.1 Added Table 605.4 Amended
Section 103.3 Amended Table 605.5 Amended
Section 106.3 Amended Table 608.1.A Added
Section 106.5.2 Added Section 608.14 Amended
Section 106.5.3 Amended Section 608.16.4 Amended
Section 107.A Added Section 608.17.9 Added
Section 107.1.3 Amended Section 608.18 Amended
Section 108.4 Amended Table 706.3 Amended
Section 108.5 Amended Section 708.3.4 Amended
Section 109.1 Amended . Table 710.1(1) Amended
Section 109.2 Amended Section 802.3.1 Amended
Section 109.2.2 Amended Section 903.1 Amended
Section 109.2.5 Amended Section 904.1 Amended
Section 109.2.6 Amended Section 917 Deleted
Section 109.5 Amended Section 1201.2 Amended
Section 110.0 Added Chapter 14 Amended
- Section 202 Amended Chapter 15 Added
Section 305.6 Amended Appendix A Deleted

Section 305.6.1 Amended



CHAPTER 1

ction 101

stion 102
Section 103
Section 104
Section 105
Section 106
Section 107
Section 108
Section 109
Section 110

CHAPTER 2

Section 201
Section 202

CHAPTER 3

Section 301
Section 302

Section 303
Section 304
Section 305

Section 306
Section 307
Section 308
Section 309

" &-~tion 310
m311
Seeiion 312

CHAPTER 4

Sectjon 401
Section 402
Section 403
Section 404
Section 405
Section 406
Section 407
Section 408
Section 409
Section 410
Section 411
Section 412
Section 413
Section 414
Section 415
Section 416
Section 417
Section 418
Section 419
Section 420
Section 421

TABLE OF CONTENTS

ADMINISTRATION

General

Applicability

Dept. Of Permits & Inspections
Duties & Powers of the Code Official
Approval

Permits

Inspections and Testing

Violations

Means of Appeal

Rules Regulations & Procedures

DEFINITIONS

General
General Definitions

GENERAL REGULATIONS

General

Exclusion of Materials Detrimental
to the Sewer System

Materials

Rodentproofing

Protection of Pipes and Plumbing
System Components

Trenching, Excavation and Backfill

Structural Safety

Piping Support

Floodproofing

Washroom and Toilet Room Requirements

Toilet Facilities for Workers
Tests and Inspections

FIXTURES, FAUCETS
AND FIXTURE FITTINGS

General

Fixture Materials :
Minimum Plumbing Facilities
Accessible Plumbing Facilities
Installation of Fixtures
Automatic Clothes Washers
Bathtubs :

Bidets

Dishwashing Machines
Drinking Fountains

Emergency Showers and Eyewash Stations

Floor Drains

Food Waste Grinder Units -
Garbage Can Washers
Laundry Trays

Lavatories

Showers

Sinks

Urinals

Water Closets

Whirlpool Bathtubs

—

O O '~ oo A UNWNN — - —

Pt gt — bk
[--IEN OS] 2 =

p—
o0

18

[ e
[=3 Ve Ne]

20

NN
(=N

Uy v ~

L ERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
"LE&lKAgHchON COUNTY

Section 422 Health Care Fixtures and Equipment
Section 423 Specialty Plumbing Fixtures
Section 424 Faucets and Other Fixture Fittings
Section 425 Flushing Devices for Water Closets
and Urinals
CHAPTERS WATER HEATERS
Section 501  General
Section 502  Installation
7 Section 503  Connections
Section 504  Safety Devices
CHAPTER6 WATER SUPPLY AND
DISTRIBUTION
Section 601  General
Section 602  Water Required
Section 603  Water Service
Section 604  Design of Building Water
Distribution System
Section 605 Material, Joints and Connections
Section 606  Installation of the Building Water
Distribution System
Section 607  Hot Water Supply System
Section 608  Protection of Potable Water Supply
Section 609  Health Care Plumbing
Section 610  Disinfection of Potable Water System
Section 611 Water Treatment Units
CHAPTER7 SANITARY DRAINAGE
Section 701  General
Section 702  Materials
Section 703  Building Sewer
Section 704  Drainage Piping Installation
Section 705  Joints
Section 706  Connections Between Drainage
Piping and Fixtures
Section 707  Prohibited Joints and Connections
Section 708  Cleanouts
Section 709  Fixture Units
Section 710  Drainage System Sizing
Section 711  Offsets in Drainage Piping in
Buildings of Five Stories or More
Section 712 Sumps and Ejectors
Section 713 Health Care Plumbing
Section 714  Computerized Drainage Design
Section 715  Backwater Valves
CHAPTERS8 INDIRECT/SPECIAL WASTE
Section 801  General
Section 802  Indirect Wastes
Section 803  Special Wastes
Section 804  Materials, Joints and Connections



CHAPTER 9

Section 901
Section 902
Section 903
Section 904
Section 905
Section 906
Section 907
Section 908
Section 909
Section 910
Section 911
Section 912
Section 913
Section 914

Section 915
Section 916
Section 917
Section 918

CHAPTER 10

Section 1001
Section 1002
Section 1003
Section 1004

CHAPTER 11

Section 1101
Section 1101
Section 1103
Section 1104
Section 1105
Section 1106
Section 1107
~Section 1108
Section 1109
Section 1110
Section 1111

CHAPTER 12

Section 1201 -

" CHAPTER 13

Section 1301
Section 1302
Section 1303

JUUUD UlUol

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

VENTS

General

Materials

Vent Stacks and Stack Vents

Vent Terminals

Vent Connections and Grades

Fixture Vents

Individual Vent

Common Vent

Wet Venting

Waste Stack Vent

Circuit Venting

Combination Drain and Vent System

Island Fixture Venting -

Relief Vents-Stacks of More Than
10 Branch Intervals

Vents for Stack Offsets

Vent Pipe Sizing

Air Admittance Valves - DELETED

Engineered Vent Systems

TRAPS

General

Trap Requirements

Interceptors and Separators
Materials, Joints and Connections

STORM DRAINAGE

General

Materials

Traps

Conductors and Connections

Roof Drains

Size of Conductors, Leaders and
Secondary (Emergency) Roof Drains
Combined Sanitary and Storm System
Values for Continuous Flow
Controlled Flow Roof Drain Systems
Sumps

FUEL PIPING
General

SPECIAL PIPING AND STORAGE
SYSTEMS

General
Medical Gases
Oxygen Systems

¥/ ASHINGTON COUNTY

63
63

85
85
85

CHAPTER 14
CHAPTER 15

APPENDIX A

APPENDIX B
APPENDIX C

Clo1
APPENDIX D

APPENDIX E

E101

E102

E103
APPENDIX F

F101

APPENDIX G -

Section G101
Section G102
Section G103
Section G104
Section G105
Section G106
Section G107
Section G108

Section G109
Section G110
Section G111

INDEX

REFERENCED STANDARDS'

TRAILER PARKS
PLUMBING STANDARDS

DELETED

RATES OF RAINFALL FOR
VARIOUS CITIES

GRAY WATER RECYCLING
SYSTEMS

Gray Water Recycling Systems

DEGREE DAY AND DESIGN
TEMPERATURES FOR CITIES
IN THE UNITED STATES

SIZING OF WATER PIPING
SYSTEM

General
Information Required
Selection of Pipe Size

STRUCTURAL SAFETY
General Information
FUEL-GAS PIPING

General

Pipe Sizing

Piping Materials

Piping System Installation

Gas Shutoff Valves

Two-psi and Higher Gas Piping

Gas Flow Controls

Installation Requirements for
Undiluted Liquefied Petroleum
Gases (Butane and Propane)

Appliance Connections

CNG Gas-dispensing Systems

Supplemental and Standby Gas Supply

93
95

.97

99
99

101

107

107
107
107

121
123

123
123
131
133
134
134
136

137

138

140
140

141



F THE CIRCUIT COURT
HINGTOM COUNTY

(1)  SECTION 101.1 shall read as follows:
SECTION 101.1 TITLE: These regulations shall be known as the Plumbing Code of
Washington County hereinafter referred to as "this code".
(2) SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF PERMITS & INSPECTIONS
SECTION 103.1 is amended and shall read as follows:
SECTION 103.1 CODE OFFICIAL: The Direétor of the Department of Permits and
Inspections of Washington County shall be known as the Code Official.

(3) SECTION 103.2.1 is added and shall read as follows:

SECTION 103.2.1 QUALIFICATIONS: Plumbing Combination Inspector hired by the

County or State government after October 1, 1988 shall meet the minimum standards established

by the County and the State Plumbing Board.

A. Applicant(s) for Combination Inspector(s) III shall hold a Master Plumber's
license issued by the State of Maryland or the applicant shall be a licensed professional
mechanical engineer with at least four (4) years experience and shall pass a written examination
| administered by the State Board.

Combination Inspector(s) III shall attend at least oﬁe (1) each year, a refresher course to
be conducted by the State Board or a course which is consistent in content with the State Board.

Combination Inspector(s) shall not be engaged or financially interested in any plumbing

business directly or indirectly, during their term of employment.



U UL L= N I ) A"

3 THE CIACUIT COURT
LERK OFINGTON COUNTY

(4)  SECTION 103.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 103.3 DEPUTIES: Combination Inspector(s) shall be hired by the County

Commissioners of Washington County, upon recommendation by the Director of Permits and
Inspecﬁons.
6)) SECTION 106.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 106.3 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT - BY WHOM APPLICATION IS
MADE: Each application for a permit, with the required fee, shall be filed with the code
official on a form furnished for that purpose and shall contain a general descriptiori of the
proposed work and its location. The permit application shall indicate the proposed occupancy of
all parts of the building and of that portion of the site or lot, if any, not covered by the building
or structure and shall éontain such other information required by the code official. Application
for a permit shall be made by a person, or an agent, to install all or part of any plumbing system.
The applicant shall meet all qualifications established by rules promulgated with this code or by
ordinance, resolution, or statute. The full names and addresses of the owner, lessee, applicant
and of the responsible officers, if the owner or lessee is a corporate body, shall be stated in the
application. The application must be signed by the Master Plumber holding a Washington |
County plumbing license and doing the work. The only exception would be when the
homeowner successfully passes a written or oral exam issued by the Washington County
Department of Permits and Inspections. Upon successfully passing the exam, the property owner
shall sign a release agreement stating his or her intention to do the plumbing in his or her place of
residence according to the Washington County homeowner provision and releasing the County

from any liability therefrom. Homeowner provisions do not apply to applications for public



or private water and sewer systems and mobile homes or gas lines. Permits shall not be
processed until it is completely filled out by the licensed contractor or homeowner.

(6) SECTION 106.5.2 shall read as follows:

SECTION 106.5.2 REGISTRATION AND PERMIT FEES SCHEDULE: The
registration and permit fees for all pluzpbing work shall be as indicated in the following schedule.
SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES AND‘LICEN SE FEES

Prior to the issuance of any permit, the applicant shall pay the following fees:

*(Regardless of the number of fixtures or appliances)

RESIDENTIAL
*Mobile Home $25.00
*Single/Modular Dwelling 30.00
*2 Family/Semi-Detached (Separa application required
for cach unif) 30.00 per unit
*Town House (Separat= spplication required for cach unit) 20.00 per unit
Connection to Water 10.00 per unit '
Connection to Sewer 10.00 per unit
Connection to Water and Sewer 15.00 per unit
*Multi-Family 25.00 per unit
Addition ¢ or more fixtres and/or spplisnces) 25.00
Remodeling !* or more fixtures snd/or appliances) 25.00
stcellaneous (additions/remodeling repairs/other) 15.00
maximum of four fixtures and/or appliances) —
List fixtures
Connection to Water 15.00
Connection to Sewer 15.00
RESIDENTIAL PACKAGE
Mobile Home with Water & Sewer 40.00
Single/Modular Dwelling with Water & Sewer - 50.00
2 gamllxﬁgm i- Detagrllgd WV“\(’lth Water & Sewer 45.00 per unit
Connection to Water & Sewer 25.00



E

Commermal/Industrlal New/addltlons/remodelmg
(Maximum of 10 fixtures and/or appliances plus $2

additional fixture and/or appliance)

Connection to Water

Connection to Sewer

Storm Drain

Connection to Water & Sewer

3

Transfer of Permit to New Plumber

Additional inspections due to condemnation or
work requiring correction, work covered up
before inspection, premature request for
inspection due to structure being locked
or no domestic hot water. Exemptions are
single fixture or single appliance replacements.
This fee due prior to any further inspections on

50.00
40.00
40.00
40.00
80.00

20.00

20.00

Non-Resident

$ 100.00
40.00
30.00

100.00

100.00

100.00
N/C
N/C
N/C

property.
LICENSING FEES
WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND
REGISTRATION, LICENSING, AND BIENNIAL FEES
Resident
Master Plumber $50.00
Journeyman 20.00
Apprentice 15.00
On-Site Contractor 50.00
Appliance Installer 50.00
Drain Cleaner 50.00
*Water Conditioner N/C
*Pump Installer N/C
*Master Well Driller N/C
*Journeyman Well Driller N/C

N/C

i

|



~ N~ W s

Upon initial registration, applicant shall pay the registration and licensing fees. The
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, may, by resolution, change
periodically the registration, licensing, and biennial fees.
*The State Tequires these types of licenses to be exempt from all licensing fees.

No additional renewal fee will be charged to applicants registering after March during the

renewal year.

) SECTION 106.5.3 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 106.5.3 FEE REFUNDS: The code official shall authorize the refunding of

fees as follows:

1. All but the application fee hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. All but the application fee when no work has been done under a permit issued in

accordance with this code.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written
application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

(8) SECTION 107.A is added and shall read as follows:

SECTION 107.A GENERAL: The responsibility for requesting an inspection shall rest

entirely with the licensed master plumber, master well driller, on-site utility contractor,
appliance, pump, and water conditioner installers. who appiied for the permit, or homeowner
who has successfully passed the homeowner's examinalion. No work shall be covered or
concealed until the work has been inspected and approved. Improper workmanship shall be
remedied and unsatisfactory materials shall be replaced as ordered by the inspector, and the
corrections shall be reinspected. All requests for inspections shall be made 24 hours in advance

of the date requested. All requests for final inspections shall be made within 48 hours after

9



00008 U1I0bL

SLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
i SfiNGTON County '

completion of all plumbing by the licensed contractor. Should the contractor fail to do so, the

homeowner may call for the final inspection.
(9)  SECTION 107.1.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

Y W All work must be inspected and receive
final approval after all plumbing fixtures and appliances connected with the water or sewer
systems are set, sewers and wells are covered, and domestic hot water must be supplied at the
time of inspection. All commercial facilities shall mark different types of piping within the
structure and tag all valves. A directory of the system in all commercial facilities éhall be placed
in the mechanical room.

(10) SECTION 108.4 shall read as follows:
SECTION 108.4 VIOL ATION PENALTIES: Any person who shall violate a provisiorf of

this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,
alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of
the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provision of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 or by imprisonment
not exceeding one year, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues
after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

(11) SECTION 108.5 shall reagl as follows:

SECTION 108.5 STOP WORK ORDERS: Upon notice from the code official, work on
any plumbing system that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous
or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to
the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent. or to the person doing the work. The notice
shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists,

10



17

UIT COURT

SOUNTY

the code official shall‘ not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any
person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $250.00 or more than $1,000.00.

(12) SECTION 109.1 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 109.1 APPLICATION FOR APPEAL: Any person shall have the right to
appeal a decision of the code official to the Plumbing Board. An application for appeal shall be
based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equally good or better
form of construction is proposed. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the

code official within 20 days after the notice was served.
(13) SECTION 109.2 shall be amended to read as follows:

SEEIIQMQQZ_MEMBEESEHR_QE_EQARD;. The Washington County Plumbing
Board shall consist of five (5) members appointed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County. The County Health Officer or the Health Officer's designee shall serve as
an ex-officio, non-voting mémber of the Board and shall not receive any additional compensation
for serving as a member. Two (2) of the members shall be master 'plumbers, three (3) members
shall be selected from the public, and each member shall reside in the County. Two (2) members
shall be selected for three (3) year terms of office, two (2) members for two (2) year terms of
office, and one (1) member for a one (1) year term of office. No member of the Washington

County Plumbing Board shall sit on the Plumbing Board for more than six (6) years except for

the Washington County Health Officers or his/her designee.

11



The Board, subject to the approval of the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, may make rules and regulations for the plumbing trade or business in Washington
County, as are necessary for the protection of the public health, welfare, and >sa.fety insofar as
they cio not conflict with the Business Occupations and Professions Article of the Annotated

Code of Maryland.

(14) SECTION 109.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 109.2.2 ALTERNATE MEMBERS: The Board of County Commissioners of

Washington County may appoint two alternate members who shall be called by the Board
chairman to hear appeals during the absence or disqualification of a member.

(15) SECTION 109.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 109.2.5 SECRETARY: The code official shail designate a qualified clerk to
serve as secretary to the Board. The secretary shall file a detailed record of all proceedings in the

Department of Permits and Inspections for Washington County, Maryland.

(16) SECTION 109.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 109.2.6 COMPENSATION OF MEMBERS: Compensation of the members

of the board who may received compensation shall be in that amount as determined by the Board

of County Commissioners.

17 SECTION 109.5 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 109.5 POSTPONED HEARING: When five members are not present to hear

an appeal, either the appellant or the appellant's representative shall have the right to request and

receive a postponement of the hearing. A new hearing shall be held within seven (7) days.

12



R e

S OF THE CIACUIT COURT
LE&I&SH!HGTON COUNTY

(18) SECTIONS 110.0 thru 110.11.1 shall read as follows:
SECTION 110.0 RULES, REGULATIONS AND PROCEDURES

SECTION 110.1 LICENSING: All licensing for the provision of plumbing services in

Washington County shall be in accordance with Title 12, Plumbers, Business and Occupations

Article, Annotated Code of Maryland.

SECTION 110.2 REGISTRATION, LICENSES AND CERTIFICATE OF
INSURANCE: No person shall be registered to perform any plumbing services nor shall any
person be issued a permit unless that individual is registered with the Washington County
Plumbing Board and has a license issued and recognized by the State of Maryland. The
Washington County Plumbing Board shall not register a master plumber, appliance installer,

| drain cleaner, or on-site utility contractor to perform 'plum'bing services in Washington County,
Maryland, without obtaining sufficient proof of insurance as set forth in Article 56, Section
© 462(C) ($300,000 general liability and $100,000 property damage). The Certificate of Insurance
shall remain in full force and effect and shall only be canceled or released by the Department of
Permits and Inspections. In order to register with the Washington County Plumbing Board,
rﬁaster plumbers, journeymen plumbers and apprentice plumbers, appliance installers, drain
cleaners, and on-site utility contractors shall pay the established registration fee at the time
application is made and pay a bi-annual renewal fee payable on or before the 31st day of May of

the renewal year. However, no additional renewal fee will be charged to applicants registering

after March during the renewal year.

SECTION 110.3 SUSPENSION, REVOCATION AND FINES: The Washington

County Plumbing Board, by a two-thirds majority decision, may suspend or revoke the

13



JUuuo UlUDO

S OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
LE&KASHINGTOH COUNTY

registration of a plumber in Washington County for a violation of this Ordinance. A plumber
shall not perform plumbing services in Washington County, Maryland, if his/her registration to
do so in Washington County is suspended or revoked. Suspension of a registration shall be for
' no mo;‘e than one (1) year. Revocation of a registration shall be for not less than one (1) year nor
more than three (3) years. Any person who has been suspended by the Washington County
Plumbing Board two (2) times, will have his registration to perform plumbing services in
Washington County revoked upon a third conviction of a violation of the Washington County
Plumbing Code. |
MWMWWM
VEHICLES: It shall be required of every master plumber to display, in a conspicuous place, a
sign with full registered name or names, and the words "Registered Plumber" or "Registered
Plumbers" in letters not less than 1-1/2 inches in size, and immediately following or underneath,
Washington County Certificate number or numbers in this same size. All vehicles owned by a
firm or corporation must display, in a conspicuous place, the name of the person(s) holding the
Master Certificate, the words "Registered Plumber" or "Registered Plumbers" and the
Washington County number or numbers. Any vehicles that are not properly lettered, the master
plumber responsible will be issued a violation notice and shall be given 30 days to correct the
violation. Failure to comply may result in legal action and the Department of Permits and
Inspections shall withhold the issuance of any permits or inspections for existing projects until

the vehicles are properly lettered.

14



SECTION 110.5 LICENSE: Before any person other than a duly licensed plumber shall

enter into the performance of the work of an "Appliance Installer", as defined, for hire, either for
himself or as the employee of another, he or she shall obtain an Appliance Installer's license

from the Plumbing Board, Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections as

follows:

SECTION 110.5.2 APPLIANCE INSTALLER'S TEST: A written or oral test will be

given by the Plumbing Board upon request. Application for the test must be received and be
accompanied by an established non-refundable fee and a letter of recommendation from a
previous employer holding a Washington County Appliance Installer's license. The applicant
'must have five (5) years prior experience before applying for license. If the applicant fails the
test, it may be retaken upon reapplication and payment of appropriate fees. The applicant must
post a score of 70 percent or higher to pass the examination. The applicant has thirty (30) days

from the test date to review the scored test.

SECTION 110.6 DRAIN CLEANERS
SECTION 110.3.6 APPLICATION: Any eligible person desiring to engage in the

business of drain cleaning shall apply for registration to the Washington County Department of
Permits and Inspections on a form and in a manner prescribed by the Plumbing Board. The

application shall be accompanied by an established non-refundable fee and a Certificate of

Insurance.

15



UuU vuWw A IRV BV

5 F THE C'RCUIT COURT
'LE\%SHINGTON COUNTY

0.7 'SP

SECTION 110.7.1 HOMEOWNER'S PERMIT: Washington County is permitted to
grant a homeowner a permit to those qualified to perform work on their own residence. The
homeowner can do plumbing in or on his or her place of residence owned by him or her.
Homeowners requesting to perform their own HANDS-ON plumbing work shall take a written
or oral examination of basic plumbing skills, given by the Washington County Department of
Permits and Inspections on a one time basis only. After receiving a score of 70% or greater the
homeowner will be permitted to obtain a plumbing permit to perform his/her own hands-on
plumbing work within the confines of his/her own dwelling, up to 3 feet (915 mm) from the
foundation wall on the building drain. Homeowners making application must sign a release
agreement stating that he/she intends to personally occupy the dwelling, that said house is not for
sale, rent or commércial use, and that the house is not being built or remodeled by the property
owner for the purpose of offering it for sale, rent or commercial use. A valid drivers license or
photo identification shall be presented at the time of examination.

SECTION 110.8 ON-SITE UTILITY CONTRACTORS

SECTION 110.8.1 APPLICATION: Any eligible person desiring to engage in the
business of being an on-site utility contractor shall apply for a license to the Washington County
Department of Permits and Inspections on a form and in the manner prescribed by the Plumbing
Board and provide a Certificate of Insurance. The application for the test must be received and
accompanied by an established non-refundable fee. The test shall be given by the Plumbing

Board. If the applicant fails the test, it may be retaken upon reapplication and payment of

16



A W N -

S F THE CIRGUIT COURT
LE\%KASHINGTOH COUNTY

appfopriate fees. The applicant must post a score of 70 percent or higher to pass the
~ examination. The applicant has thirty (30) days from the test date to review the scored test.
ION1 D 1 VI

SECTION 110.9.1 COMPLAINTS: The Board shall receive all complaints of any
alleged violation of the Plumbing Code filed against any individual registered by the Board.
These complaints must be in writing setting forth the nature of the alleged complaint, the time,
date and location where alleged violation was committed, and signed by the person filing the
complaint. The Board shall notify all parties to appear for a hearing on the alleged violation and
written notices shall be sent at least seven days prior as to the time and place of hearing. The

Board shall conduct the hearing which shall be recorded.

SECTION 110.10 TRANSFER OF PLUMBING FEES

SECTION 110.10.1 SCOPE: There will be NO TRANSFER OF PLUMBING FEES OR

' PLUMBING PERMITS except with the following considerations.

A release letter from the homeowner and Master Plumber who orig-inated the permit must
be presented to the Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections, stating the
reason(s) for desiring a transfer. If a transfer of a plumbing permit is approved by the
Washington County Department of Perrnit;s and Inspections, an established transfer fee wi_lI be
charged the new plumber. Should the original master plumber refuse to release his permit, the
code official will review the reasons the master plumber will not release or why a release aor
transfer is needed. The code official will the render his decision to release or transfer. Should .

either party disagree with the code official’s decision, they would have the right to appeal that

decision to the Washington County Plumbing Board.

17



o N W I W P NS b

S OF THE CiRCUIT COURT
LE&IKASHIHGTON CQUMTY

SECTION110.11.1 PUBLIC SYSTEMS AVAILABLE: A public water main or public

sewer system shall be considered available to a building when the building is located within 350

feet of the public water main or sewer.
(19) 'SECTION 202 DEFINITION OF PLUMBING TERMS is amended by adding (*) to
the following definitions: |

*Appliance Installer: “Appliance installer” shall mean any person who installs self-
contained appliances to existing water and/or sewer piping systems, not including gas (natural,
propane or LP), including, but not limited to, humidifiers, dehumidifiers, ice-makefs,
dishwashers clothes-washers and instant hot dispensers, and such work is done as part of a retail
sales business, as part of a service business or part of a business involving the sale of gas,
electricity or other fuel with which such appliances are operated, whether such person owns the
business or installs said appliances as the employee of another.

*Drain Cleaners: “Drain cleaners” shall mean any individual, person, or firm who offers
to engage in the work of cleaning sanitary sewer drains for hire.

*On-Site Utility Contractor: “On-site utility contractor” shall mean any individual,
person, or firm who performs plumbing work while installing public water or public sewage no
closer than five (5) feet from a building being serviced.

*Service Building: Buildiﬁg housing toilet, bathing, laundry and such other facilities as
may be required.

*Sewer Connection: That portion of the drainage piping which extends as a single

terminal under the trailer coach for connection with the trailer park drainage system.

18



*Trailer Coach: Any camp-car, trailer, or other vehicle with or without motive power,
designed and constructed to travel on the public thoroughfares in accordance with provisions of

the Vehicle Code and designed or used for human habitation.

*Trailer Coach-Dependent: A trailer coach which is not equipped with a water closet

for sewage disposal.

*Trailer Coach-Independent: A trailer coach which is equipped with a water closet for
sewage disposal. |

*Trailer Coach Drain Connection: The removable extension connecting the &ailer
- coach drainage system to the trailer connection fixture.

*Trailer Coach-Left Side: The side farthest from the curb when the trailer home is

being towed or in transit.

*Trailer Connection Fixture: A connection to a trap which is connected to the park
drainage system, and receives the water, liquid, or other waste discharge from a trailer coach.

*Trailer Park Drainage System: The entire system of drainage piping used to con\?ey
sewage or other waste fro;x? a trailer connection fixture to the sewer.

*Trailer Park Branch Line: That portion of drainage piping which receives the
discharge from not more that two trailer connection fixtures.

*Trailer Park: Any area or tract of land where space is fented or held-out for rent, or
occupied by two or more trailer coaches.

*Trailer Park Sewer System: That piping which extends from the public or private

sewage disposal system to a point where the first trailer park drainage system branch fitting is

installed.



JuUuuuuuuv Viuvier»e
< K OF THE CIACUIT COURT
LE\B‘IASHIHGTOH COUNTY

*Trailer Park Water Service Main: That portion of the water distribution system
which extends from the street main, water meter, or other source of supply to the trailer site water
service branch.

V*Trailer Site: That area set out by boundaries on which shall be located one trailer.

*Trailer Site Waste Service Branch: That portion of the water distributing system
extended from the park service main to a trailer site, and includes connections, devices, and
appuﬁenances thereto.

*Water Service Connection: That portion of water supply piping which extends as a
singly terminal under the trailer coach for connection with the trailer coach park water supply

system. -

(20) SECTION 305.6 is amended and shall read as follows:
SECTION 305.6 WATER LINE DEPTH: Water service and well line piping shall be

installed below recorded frost penetration but not less than 3 feet (915 mm) below grade. In
climates with freezing temperatures, plumbing piping in exterior building walls or areas
subjected to freezing temperatures shall be protected against freezing by insulation or heat or
both.
(21) SECTION 305.6.1 is amended and shall read as follows:
SECTION 305.6.1 SEWER DEPTH: Building sewers that connect to private sewage
disposal systems shall be a minimum of 8 inches (203 mm) to 30 inches (762 mm) below the
finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building sewers that connect to public

sewers shall be a minimum of 30 inches (762 mm) below grade.



(22) DELETE: Sections 404.1 through 404.3.4 in its entirety then amend Sections 404.1 to

read as follows:

SECTION 404.1 WHERE REQUIRED: Assessible plumbing fixtures shall conform to
COMAR .05.02.02 Maryland Accessibility Code.

(23) SECTION 412.4 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 412.4 REQUIRED LOCATION AND CONSTRUCTION: In public coin-
operated laundries and in the central washing facilities of multiple family dwellings, the rooms
containing the automatic clothes washers shall be provided with ﬂqor drains located to feadily ‘
drain the entire floor area. Such drains shall have a minimum outlet cross section of not less than
3 inches (76 mm) in diameter and shall have a trap primer device.

Amend Table 605.4 by deleting L, WL, M or WM under “Copper or copper alley
tubing.

An amended Table 605.4 is shown below:

21



Table 605.4
WATER SERVICE PIPE

MATERIAL

STANDARD

Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene
(ABS plastic pipe

ASTM D 1527; ASTM D 2282

Asbestos cement pipe

ASTM C 296

Brass pipe

ASTM B 43

Copper or copper alloy pipe

ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

Copper or copper alloy tubing
(Type K, WK)

ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88
ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride
(CPVC) plastic pipe

ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441;
ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6

Galvanized steel pipe

ASTM A 53

Polybutylene (PB) plastic pipe
and tubing

ASTM D 2662; ASTM D 2666;
ASTM D 3308; CSA B137.8

Polybutylene (PE) plastic pipe

ASTM D 2239; CSA
CAN/CSA-B137.1

Polyethylene.(PE) plastic tubing

ASTM D 2737; CSA B137.1

Cross-linked polyethylene
(PEX) plastic tubing

ASTM 876; ASTM F 877;
CSA CAN/CSA-B137.5

Cross-linked polyethylene/
Aluminum/cross linked
polyethylene (PEX-AL-PEX)
pipe

ASTM F 1281; CSA
CAN/CSA B137.10

Polyethylene/aluminum/
Polyethylene (PE-AL-PE)
pipe

ASTM F 1282; CSA
CAN/CSA B 137.9

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC)
* plastic pipe

ASTM D 1785; ASTM D 2241;

ASTM D 2672; CSA
CAN/CSA B137.3

Amend Table 605.5 by deleting L, WL, M, WM under “Copper or copper alloy tubing".

22




e

: 5 OF THE CIACUIT COURT
An amended Table 605.5 is shown beloé’vgzgi’ZSHmGTOH COUNTY
Table P-605.5
WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE
MATERIAL STANDARD
Brass Pipe : ASTM B 43
Chlorinated polyvinyl chloride ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 441
(CPVC) plastic pipe and tubing ASTM F 442; CSA B137.6
Copper or copper-alloy pipe ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302
Copper or copper-alloy tubing ASTM B 75; ASTM B 88
(Type K, WK, L, WL) ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447
Cross-linked polyethylene ASTMF 887; CSA
(PEX) plastic tubing CAN/CSA-B137.5
Cross-linked polyethylene/ ASTM F 1281; CSA
Aluminum/cross-linked CAN/CSA-B137.10
Polyethylene (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe
Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A 53
Polybutylene (PB) plastic pipe ASTM D 3309; CSA
and tubing _ CAN3-B137.8

23



*3]qeidaooe jou ase suoiun (e)

s1asuadsp a3eroAag-

- sdwind
S d
> 2, 183y 03 s31em dn-adpej-
= SYOBI UMOPYSEM -
bJ WW qqiq asotf adeosspue-]-
| @O DVAH Pa]002 1ajep-
) .mwM slaysemuysip
wit= [eIDIOWIWO))-
N =2
X S19ZI|119S-
)l WX juowdinbo [endsoy-
AN e wawdinba qef otoyy-
| &F juswdinba .
N A Fuissanoad pooy-
sauipaay jood IIEYY
Suiwunms 2 qni oy 0oy} 03 padid ures(g- )3} suaydsouny yum (e)
‘seds ‘siajloq ‘[enuspisay- J uomnsod Auy- | -pojy 01 mor dd % Sd SA[BA o9y [eng ¢l01 3SSv
apesd
aaoqe (,9) sayoul 9 1583} 1y~ A Y3YL yum
SY209|[IS speaty) layealg wnnoep (e)
pue ‘sjueipAy ‘sqqiq asoH I qq!q 3soy uo payd207- Mo St qqig IsoH4 1101 9SSV
asn JuaWIuIo) (snonunuo)=5H) UONISOJ PUE SUOISUDUIL(] plezepy ainssaid yoeq=4q) POy Jaquinp
(uanruuayuy=[) uonejjesu| (a3euoydis yorq-5q) 10 301A3(Q plepuels
uonIpuo)) 2Inssaly

uol123j014 jo adK |

SAI[AA( UONUIAALJ MOPYIBY JO UoijeIo/adA ],

V1’809 21qeL




Y4

"OAJBA JJO-INYS 13Ul 3Y) JO peaye Pa][eISu 3q [[RYS A[EA UIBID UMM JOUIRI)S-A YSSW UL Y @)
*9]qeidasoe Jou ale suojuny (e)

R

~/

v W U

—
oc
B>
—
x
3 s1awes)s
m% pue $13j002
o ainssaid 931e-
2o S)IBI UMOPYSBA - Ajuo [eyuoziioy-
W (piezey - (do0y
M Mmoj 11 adK) 0) 3ul] 131u32) (,,8§) Ssayoul Ajquassy
T swaysAs 8v 01(.81) sayour g AJRA ¥934D @
= Japjunds airg- 0) - Suipjing apisuj- Mo dd % sd JIqnog S101 9SSV
Jopunds a1 g-
B_pjuuds ume-
juswidinba
jendsoy-
seds
2% sjood Sujwiwims
‘s12]10q [BI12J3WWO))- Ajuo jeyuoziioy- 19JUdA31g
S12M0) Surjoo)- (1001J 03 aul] 191ua2) moljyjoeg (q)
1ajem paf[1yD- (u8%) sayour gy 01 (,81) 3U0Z aInssald (®)
Sjue) fed1wayy- o) sayout g1 - Juipjing apisul- Y3ty dd % s4 padnpay €101 9SSV
asn YpWwo)) plezeH (sanssaid yoeq=4q) poydN JaquinN
(snonupuo)n=oH) uonisod pue suoisuawi(] (e3euoydis yoeq=gq) 10 321A9(] piepuels
(Quamunaug=g) uonej[esu] uo13993014 jo adK |,
uonipuc)) aInssald
SIINAI(Q UOHUIAILY MOF g JO UOBIOT/AdA Y,

VI'g0. <L



9¢

"ajqejdasoe Jou ale suojun (&)

®
ad£y aun
(s3uipping | -t
adA] ) swalsAs 9|quadlALag
C Japjunids aing- o) Ajuo uonysod [ejuoziiop Mo dg » sd %934 1eng vz01 ASSV
D
b
% skeids asnoH-
RS sieyd [ejua(g-
m = sioyetu 301-
L~ SjuelpAy paung-
2 921A9p A13A0931
ww 352513 oneWOINY-
<« suIeIuNoy ()
gW Funjuuip apisinQ- J uotysod Kuy Moy dg9 % S4 FI3yH feng vc01 3SSV
" Iopjundg umey-
(stoopino
pateo0] aq 1Snur)
sjood Juiwtnmg- AJuo [eoia A
syjue) 010Yd- (3apno 1ayeaig
sauojeloqe]- 152431y aaoqe (,,09) sayoul wnnoep (®)
s19s82132Q- o) 09 03 (,T1) sayour Z |- Y3y dd % Sd | 2dAJ ainssaid 0Z01 ASSVY
s JusWILU0D plezey (a1nssaid yoeq=dq) poyIdN JaquinN
(snonunuon=)) uonIsod pue suoisuswig (a8euoydis yoeq=5g) J0 291A9(J piepue)g

(uaniuuaul=|)
uoIIpUOY) 3Inssald

uoije[jeisuj

uond9j0id Jo adAy,

$321A3(] UOTJUIAAL] MOJYdE JO uonedoTadL],

Y1°'809 31q¢E.L




-V WU Y (W B S

CLERK OF THE CiRCUIT COURT
WASHINGTOH COUNTY

(24)— SECTION 608.14 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 608.14 LOCATION OF BACKFLOW PREVENTERS: Backflow prevention
devices shall be in accordance with Table 608.1A. These devices shall be installed in accessible
locations for ease of maintenance, replacement and testing.  Adequate hea&oom shall be
provided and a minimum of 30 inches (762 mm) of non-obstructed space shall be provided in
front of devices and a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm) shall be provided behind devices larger

than 2 inches (51 mm).

Backflow devices shall be installed inside a building in an area capable of maintéining a

temperature above freezing.

(25) SECTION 608.16.4 is amended and shall read as follows: _
WWEM&

AWESEI_EM_S: The potable water supply to automatic fire sprinkler and

| standpipe systems shall be protected against backflow by a double chec;k-valve assembly or a

reduced pressure principle backflow preventer. All supply valves serving these devices shall be

locked in the open position and shall be accessible.

Exceptions:

1. Where systems are installed as a portion of the water distribution system in
accordance with the requirements of this code and are not provided with a fire
department connection, isolation of the water supply system shall not be required.

2. Isolation of the water distribution systems is not required for deluge, preaction or

dry pipe systems.

27



UyUuuyuo uvivucg
s HE CifCUIT COURT
LERK fINGTON COUNTY

(26) SECTION 608.17.9 is added and shall read as follows:

SECTION 608.17.9 PUMP TANK INSTALLATION: Any pressure tank installed in a
basement and/or crawl space shall be a minimum of 7 %2 inches (191 mm) above finished grade.
All wétér pressure tanks and apparatus for mobile homes shall be installed in the confines of the
living space. In every case, the only exception shall be those tanks installed a minimum of 18
inches (457 mm) from the top of the tank to finished grade in an approved manhole with a water
tight lid, 2 minimum of 6 inches (152 mm) above finished grade.

(27) SECTION 608.18 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 608.18 PERIODICAL TESTING: Periodic tests and inspections shall be made
by a certified backflow technician, licensed in the state of Maryland for all backflow preventers
to determine whether ther are operable. Reduced pressure principle backflow preventers (ASSE
1013) double check valve assemblies (ASSE 1015). Double detector check-valve breakers
(ASSE 1040), pressure type vacuum breaker (ASSE 1020) shall be inspected and tested after
their initial installation. Test shall be done annually and an overhaul shall be done as needed.

Results shall be recorded on forms provided by the Washington County Department of Permits

-and Inspections.

28



(AR

~ l CU
AR

(28) SECTION 706.3 Table amended as follows:

TABLE 706.3
FITTINGS FOR CHANGE IN DIRECTION
CHANGE IN DIRECTION
TYPg. A%QNT-ING N Horizontal to Vertical to Horizontal to

vertical horizontal horizontal
Sixteenth bend X X X
Eighth X X X
Sixth bend X X X
Quarter bend X X
Short sweep X X
Long sweep X X X
Sanitary tee X* X
Wye X ’ X
Combination wye X
and eighth bend

For SI: 1 inch =25.4

a The fiitings shall be permitted for a 2-inch or smaller fixture drain
b Thre inches and larger

c ‘mitation on double sanitary tees. see Section 706.3.

(29) SECTION 708.3.4 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 708.3.4 BASE OF STACK:: A cleanout shall be provided at the base of each waste or

soil stack. The center of the main stack cleanout shall be a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm)

above the finished floor.



- THE CiRCUIT €
SLERK OF NGTOH COUNTY

(36) CHAPTER 1500 TRAILER PARKS PLUMBING STANDARDS, Sections 1500 through 1509 ar -

added to read as follows:

1 rail ing Stand

1502 Sﬂ QQPE; The primary objection of this chapter is to assure sanitary plumbing installations in
trailer‘hom’e parks. |

SECTION 1503 STANDARDS:

SECTION 1503.1 - Plumbing systems hereafter installed in trailer home parks shall conform to the
provisions set forth in the preceding sections of these Regulations, where applicable, and aiso to the provisions
set forth in this Section. Trailer home park plumbing and drainage systerhs, in addition, shall conform to all
other applicable Administrative Authority regulations.

SECTION 1503.2 PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS. Before any plumbing or sewerage disposal
facilities are installed or altered in any trailer park, duplicate plans and specifications shall be filed, and proper
permits obtained from the Administrative Authority. Plans shall show in detail:

(1) Plot plan of the park, drawn to scale, indicating elevations, property lines, driveways, existing or

proposed buildings, and the sizes of trailer sites;

(2) Complete specification and piping layout of proposed plumbing system or alteration; and

(3) Complete specification and layout of proposed sewage disposal system or alteration.

SECTION 1503.3 - Trailer park plixmbing_ system shall be designed and installed according to the

requirements of the plumbing code and shall. in addition, conform to all other pertinent local ordinances and

State regulations.

SECTION 1503.4 MATERIALS: Materials shall conform to the approved standards set forth in other

sections of the plumbing code.

32



(VEURUEUEVIEF IS

LERK Qe TS GOUNTY

| SECTION 1504.1 -The Trailer Park Drainage System shall be designed and installed in accordance with
the requirements of the Plumbing Code, or may be installed by the use of a waste and vent drainage system,
which shall conéist bf an installation of waste piping, as provided in this regulation; in which the traps for one or
more trailer connection fixtures are not separately or independently vented, but which are vented through the
waste piping as such size to secure free circulation of air therein.

SECTION 1504.2 - Each independent trailer site shall be provided with a trapped trailer connection

which shall consist of a 3 inch (76) horizontal iron pipe-size threaded connection, installed a minimum of 3
inches (76 mm) and a maximum of 6 inches (162 mm) (from the bottom of the connection), above the ﬁni‘shed

grade. The vertical connection to the trailer connection fixture shall be anchored in a concrete slab 4 inches

(100 mm) thick, and 18 inches by 18 inches (457 mm by 457 mm) square.

SECTION-1504.3 - Any part of the plumbing system extending above the ground shall be protected from

damage when deemed necessary by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 1504.4 - Each trailer site sﬁall be provided with a 3 inch I.P.S. male or female threaded
:onnection extending above the surrounding grade from a 3 inch (76 mm) minimum size vented P-trap. Traps
hall be located with reference to the immediate boundary lines of the designated space or area within éach
-ailer site that will actually be occupied by the trailer. Each such trap shall be located in the rear third quarter
zction along the left boundary line of the trailer parking area not less than 1 foot (305 mm) or more than 3 feet
15 mm) from the road side of the trailer and shall be a minimum of 5 feet (1524 mm) from the rear boundary

“the trailer site. This location may be varied by permission of the Administrative Authority when unusual

:nditions are encountered.

33



SECTION 1504.5 - All traps, tail pipes, vertical vents, the upper 5 feet (1524 mm) of any horizontal
vent, and the ‘ﬁrst 5 feet (1524 mm) of any trap branch shall be fabricated from materials approved for use
within a building.

SECTION 1504.6 - A vertical pipe shall not be used in a special waste and .vent system, except the. vent -
pipe, and the connection to the trailer connection fixture.

SECTION 1504.7 - Mobile home and travel trailer drain connections shall be of approved senﬁ-ﬁgid or
flexible reinforced hose having smooth interior surfaces and not less than 3 inches (76 mm) inside diameter.
Drain connections shall be eqﬁipped with a standard quick disconnect screw or clamp type fitting, not less in
size that the outlet. Drain connections shall be gas-tight and no longer than necessary to maké the connection
between the trailer coach drain connection and the trailer connection fixture on the site.

SECTION 1504.8 - Cleanouts shall be provided as required, except cleanouts shall be provided in the
vent stacks 1 foot (305 mm) above grade. |

SECTION 1504.9 - For the purpose of determining pipe sizes, each trailer site connection shall be
assigned a waste loading value of six fixture units and each trailer park drainage system shall be sized as
, ’provided,_.in Table 1805A.1.

SECTION 1504.10 - Minimum grade for sewers shall be so designed that ta slope sufficient to provide a
mean velocity of 2 feet (610 mm) per second when the pipe is flowing full or half full.

SECTION 1504.11 - The discharge of the park drainage system shall be connected to a public sewer. If
a public sewer is not available within 350 feet (106.75 m) for use, an individual sewage disposal system shall be
installed, of a type that is acceptable and approved by the Code Official.

SECTION 1504.12 - Minimum pipe size for drainage systems shall be as set forth in Table 1504.12.1.

34



vy Lvwu v vUiluvuuJ
0

CLERK OF THE C!ACUIT COURT
WASHINGTOH COUHTY

TABLE 1504.12.1

Max. No. of Trailers Max. No. of Trailers
Individually Vented Wet-Vented Size of
Systems Systems Drain
2 . 1 3n*
30 . lo ) 4||.
100 50 6"
400 ** o8
1,000 ke 10"

*The maximum length of any three inch trap branch is six feet from its vent.
*+Vill require special design. Consult Administrative Authority.

SECTION 1503 - VENTING:

SECTION 1505.1 - Each wet-vented drainage system shall be provided with a vent not more than 15 feet
(68.63 m) downstream from its upper trap. and long mains shall be provided with additional relief véiits at
ir"  3ls of not more than 100 feet (30.5 m) thereafter. The minimum size of each vent serving a wet-vented
system shall be as set forth in Table 1505.2.

TABLE 1505.2

Size of Wet-Vented Drain A Minimum Size of Vent
3" 2"
2"
. 4" ‘ 3."4
3"
5" 4"
: i 4n
6" 5"
5"

SECTION 1505.2 - The drainage s}'stem of a utility or other building, shall not discharge into a wet-

:nted line. A house sewer shall not discharge into a wet-vented line.

35



SECTION 1505.3 - A house sewer or part of a house sewer shall not function as a wet-vent.

SECTION 1505.4 - All vent intersections shall be taken off above the center line of the horizontal pipe.
All vent stacks shall be supported by a 4 inch by 4 inch (100 mm by 100 mm) treated post, set in at least 2 feet
(610 mm) of coﬁcrete extending at least 4 inches above the ground, or supported by another approved method.

SECTION 1505.5 - Galvanized steel vent pipe may extend below the ground vertically, and may directly
intersect a drainage line with an approved fitting, if the entire section around both the drain and the galvanized
pipe is encased in concrete to prevent any movement. Galvanized steel pipe encased in concrete shall be first .

coated with bituminous paint, or equivalent protective material.

SECTION 1505.6 - Vent pipes shall be located at least 10 feet (3.05 m) above grade and 10 feet from the.
property line. A vent terminal from a drainage system may not be directly beneath any door, window, or other
ventilating openings of the building or of an adjacent building, and any such vent terminal may not be within 10
feet horizontally of such an opening unless it is at least 3 feet (915 mm) above the top of the opening.

SECTION 1505.7 - All vent stacks in the wet-vented system shall be 3 inches or more in diameter,
except that a 3 inch (76 mm) branch line may be vented by 2 inch (51 mm) vent.

SECTION 1505.8 - A 3 inch (76 mm) branch.line shall not exceed 6 feet in length, and no 4 inch branch
shall exceed 15 feet in length, unless they are separately vented. |

SECTION 1505.9 - Each trailer connection fixture outlet shall be provided with a screw-type plug or

cap, and be effectively capped when not use.
SECTION 1506 WATER DISTRIBUTING SYSTEM:
SECTION 1506.1 - Each trailer park water distributing system shall conform to the requirements of this

code and shall be so designed and maintained as to provide a residual pressure of not less than 20 p.s.i. at each

trailer site under normal operating conditions.

36



yuuU vy [ B VAN |

SLERK OF THE CIRCIHT COURT
W ASHINGTOR COUNTY

SECTION 1506.2 - Every trailer site shall be providéd with an individual water service branch line
which shall be not less than 3/4 inches (19 mm) in diameter, delivering safe, potable water.

SECTION 1506.3 - A control valve shall be installed on the water service branch, followed by a spring-
loaded check vélve on the discharge side of the control valve, with a pressure relief valve located on the
discharge side of the spring-loaded check valve, with a hose connection or other approved attachment on the -
trailer side of the relief valve. Each pressure relief valve shall be equipped with a full-size drain with the end of
the pipe not more than 2 feet (610 mm) or less than 6 inchés (152 mm}) above the ground and pointing
downward.. The drain may terminate at other approved locations. No part of the drain pipe shall be trapped. A
.shut-off Qalve shall not be installed between pressure relief valve and the trailer it serves. The backflow device

and relief valve shall be located not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the grade.
SECTION 1506.4 - The service connection shall not be rigid. Flexible metal tubing is permitted.

‘ngs at either end shall be of a quick disconnect type not requiring any special tools or knowledge to install

or remove.

SECTION 1506.5 - Each trailer outlet on the water distribution system shall be rated at 6 water fixture
units.
SECTION 1506.6 - Location of water connection. The trailer park water outlet for each trailer coach

space shall be located near the center of the left side of each trailer coach.
SECTION 1506.7 - Fire protection. In the design of the water distribution system in a trailer park,

consideration for fire outlet stations throughout the park should be made relative to the location and quantity of

water necessary during an emergency period.

37



SECTION 1507.1 - Public toilets, baths, and lavatories shall be installed and maintained for each sex in

accordance with the following ratio of trailer sites:

SECTION 1507.2 - Trailer parks constructed and operated exclusively for independent trailers shall have

one toilet; one shower; and one lavatory for each 100 sites or fractional part of them.

SECTION 1507.3 - Trailer parks constructed and operated exclusively for independent trailers shall have

one toilet; one shower; and one lavatory for each 100 sites or fractional part of them.

SECTION 1507.4 - Trailer parks constructed and operated for the combined use of dependent and

independent trailers shall have the foll‘owing facilities:

(a) One additional toilet shall be provided for each 100 sites or fractional part thereof in
excess of 70 sites.
(b) Each toilet shall be for the exclusive use of the occupants of the trailer sites in the trailer ’
park.
TABLE 1507.4.1
Sites Toilets ~ Showers Lavatories
2-25 1 1 1
26-70 2 2 2

SECTION 1507.5 - In every auto and trailer park, shower baths or other bathing facilities with hot and

cold running water shall be installed in separate compartments. Every compartment shall be provided with a

self-closing door or otherwise equipped with a waterproof draw curtain.

SECTION 1507.6 - Laundry facilities. Every trailer park shall be provided with an accessory utility

building containing at least one mechanical washing machine or laundry tray equipped with hot and cold

38



minning water for every 20 trailer sites or fractional part of them but in no case shall there be less than two
launary trays in any trailer park.

SECTION 1507.7 - Bathing or shower compartments. The imer face of walls of all bathing shower
comﬁartments shall' be finished with cement, concrete, metal, tile, or other approved waterproof materials
extending to a height of not less than 6 feet (1.8 m) above the floor. Floors of shower compartments shall be

made of concrete or other similar impervious material. Floors shall slope to floor drains at the rate of 1/4 inch

per foot.

SECTION 1508 MAINTENANCE: All required devices or safeguards shall be maintained in good

working order. The owner, operator, or lessee of the trailer park or his designated agent shall be responsible for
their maintenance. When wash rooms or toilet rooms are installed, thgy must conform with these regulations.

SECTION 1509 RESPONSIBILITY-VIOLATIONS-OPERATOR'S RESPONSIBILITY: When it is
ev: '*jt that there exists, or may exist, a violation of any pertinent regulation the owner, operator, lessee, person
in charge of the park, or any other person causing a violation shall immédiately disconnect the trailer water

supply and sewer connection from the park systems and shall employ such other corrective measures as may be
srdered by the Code Official.

Adopted this "H"- day of Oc}o—br./\ , 1997.

Effective the 7K. day of Ockben . 1997
\TTEST: ' BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

_ %WASHINGTON CO , MARYLAND

oni L. Bittner, Clerk » Gregory L.

22 Z
ﬁhn S. Shank. Vice President

39



Approved as to legal sufficiency:

Beth L. Evans
Assistant County Attorney

Mail to:

County Attorney's Ofﬁce

100 W. Washington Street, Room 213
Hagerstown, MD 21740

HAORDINANC\PLUMBING.93\PLUM-97.AMD

SLE

Juu
R
¥

KO
AS

uuo
OF T
HIN

Uiudy

HE CIRCUIT COURT

GTON COUNTY

:// ) \ \, {/\ \
oA TG

Ronald L. Bowers

/Y L//<L / vbhe{,/

R. Lee Downey

o 12

James

40

ade

10/2/9



